5/17/22, 4:43 PM Mail - Denise Tay (LKKAuto) - Outlook

FW: SJP 82K FINALISE

Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>
Tue 17/5/2022 4:34 PM
To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@Ilkkauto.com>

Hi Denise.
Attached marking, workshop agreed COR below. Photos in Merimen.

Regards
Taufikh

From: Tsl Auto [mailto:tslautogarage@gmail.com]
Sent: Friday, 13 May 2022 9:20 PM

To: Taufikh (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: SIP 82K FINALISE

Ok we close at this amount

On Fri, 13 May 2022 at 12:16 PM, Taufikh (LKK Auto) <taufikh@lkkauto.com> wrote:
HI,

“Without Prejudice”

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of lumpsum $14,400/- with 7 days of
repair, subject to their approval.

Regards
Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: Ts| Auto [mailto:tslautogarage@gmail.com]
Sent: Monday, 9 May 2022 9:26 PM

To: Taufikh (LKK Auto)

Subject: Fwd: SJP 82K FINALISE

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Tsl Auto <tslautogarage(@gmail.com>
Date: Fri, 29 Apr 2022 at 11:14 PM

Subject: Re: SJP 82K FINALISE

To: Taufikh (LKK Auto) <taufikh@lkkauto.com>

On Mon, 4 Apr 2022 at 5:16 PM, Tsl Auto <tslautogarage@gmail.com> wrote:

Hi Taufikh
Can we close at Lumpsum $14,950

Thanks regards
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5/17/22, 4:43 PM Mail - Denise Tay (LKKAuto) - Outlook
On Mon, 4 Apr 2022 at 1:26 PM, Taufikh (LKK Auto) <taufikh@]lkkauto.com> wrote:

HI,
“Without Prejudice”

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of lumpsum $14,050/- with 7 days of
repair, subject to their approval.

Regards
Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: Tsl Auto [mailto:tslautogarage@gmail.com]
Sent: Sunday, 3 April 2022 6:36 PM

To: Taufikh (LKK Auto)

Subject: Fwd: SIP 82K FINALISE

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: Tsl Auto <tslautogarage@gmail.com>
Date: Thu, 17 Mar 2022 at 10:52 PM

Subject: Re: SJP 82K FINALISE

To: Taufikh (LKK Auto) <taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Can we close at $15,800 lump sum

On Thu, 17 Mar 2022 at 6:08 PM, Taufikh (LKK Auto) <taufikh@]lkkauto.com> wrote:
HI,

“‘Without Prejudice”

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of lumpsum $13,450/- with 7 days
of repair, subject to their approval.

Regards

Taufikh
Lkk Auto
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