Hui Zhen (LKK Auto)

From:

Sent:

To:

Subject:
Attachments:

Dear Huizhen,

TeamAuto Pro <teamautoffice@gmail.com>

Tuesday, 21 September 2021 4:44 PM

Hui Zhen (LKK Auto); Admin A

Re: LOD - Our Ref: SJF 7482X and Your Ref: SHC 4731L (SMRT) / DOA: 06-09-2021
REVISED LOD. SJF7482X. SHC4731L. 060921.pdf

I have received instruction from our Estimate department to have COR revised to $4300 (Excl. GST).

Kindly see attached our revised COR and Proforma Invoice.

BY EMAIL

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Our Ref: SJF 7482X
Your Ref: SHC 4731L

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Accident Involving:
Date of Accident:

SJF 7482X and SHC 4731L

6 September 2021

Location of Accident: Lentor Ave

We refer to the above-mentioned accident and hereby submit our claim as below, with the relevant documents attached.

Cost of Repair Inc. GST
TOTAL LOR/U DAYS

4,601.00 $4300 COR Agreed + $301 GST
11 DAYS 2 Days PRS (7/8 Sep) + 1 Day Resurvey (9 Sep) + 7
Repair Days Agreed (10/11/13/14/15/16/17 Sep) + 1

Sunday (12 Sep)

Add Loss of Rental S 960.00 g pays : Inv#2109.2337
Add Loss of Use S 240.00 3 pays

Total S 5,801.00

Add LTA search Fee S 7.45

GRAND TOTAL $ 5,808.45

Please feel free to contact us if you have any query otherwise kindly pay the Grand Total Amount to :

Team AutoPro Pte Ltd



160 Sin Ming Drive #02-12
Sin Ming AutoCity
Singapore 575722

Thank you.

*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall not
prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his personal
injuries.*

**Dear all, please note that Team AutoPro Pte Ltd is GST registered w.e.f. 13th January 2021.

Cheers,

Adel

Team AutoPro Pte Ltd
Tel: 6258 1955

Fax: 6258 1956

Main Office: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #02-12 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722
Workshop/Survey Venue: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722

On Mon, Sep 20, 2021 at 2:07 PM TeamAuto Pro <teamautoffice@gmail.com> wrote:
BY EMAIL

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Our Ref: SJF 7482X
Your Ref: SHC 4731L

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Accident Involving: SJF 7482X and SHC 4731L
Date of Accident: 6 September 2021
Location of Accident: Lentor Ave

We refer to the above-mentioned accident and hereby submit our claim as below, with the relevant documents attached.

Cost of Repair Inc. GST S 4,614.91 $4313 COR Agreed + $301.91 GST

TOTAL LOR/U DAYS 11 DAYS 2 Days PRS (7/8 Sep) + 1 Day Resurvey (9 Sep) +7
Repair Days Agreed (10/11/13/14/15/16/17 Sep) + 1

Sunday (12 Sep)

Add Loss of Rental S 960.00 g pays : Inv#2109.2337

2



Add Loss of Use S 240.00 3 pays

Total S 5,814.91

Add LTA search Fee S 7.45
S

GRAND TOTAL 5,822.36

Please feel free to contact us if you have any query otherwise kindly pay the Grand Total Amount to :

Team AutoPro Pte Ltd
160 Sin Ming Drive #02-12
Sin Ming AutoCity
Singapore 575722

Thank you.

*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall not
prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his personal
injuries.*

**Dear all, please note that Team AutoPro Pte Ltd is GST registered w.e.f. 13th January
2021.

Cheers,

Adel

Team AutoPro Pte Ltd
Tel: 6258 1955

Fax: 6258 1956

Main Office: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #02-12 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722
Workshop/Survey Venue: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: TeamAutoPro North <teamautopl@gmail.com>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: TeamAutoPro North <teamautopl@gmail.com>

Date: Tue, Sep 7, 2021 at 3:03 PM

Subject: Re: NR PRI D21/2524M/SMRT/SS 2 Days Notice: SJF 7482 X (Our Ref) and SHC 4731 L (Your
Ref) 3rd Party: FIRST CAPITAL Dated 06/09/2021

To: MTPRI <MTPRI@smrt.com.sg>

Cc: MTPRI <MTPRI@smrt.com.sg>, Ashlene Lee Bee Gan (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd)
<BeeGan.Lee@strides.com.sg>

Dear Hua Yen

With reference to your list of surveyors, we are agreeable with the appointment of M/s LKK Lim Teow Guan as
the SJE for subject claim.




Kindly note our personnel in charge for the survey as follows:-

Contact Person Eric Lee 8879 9997

Email Address teamautopl@gmail.com
Survey Address 160 Sin Ming Dr, #01-14 Singapore 575722

Thank you for your kind attention to our request.

I

*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall not
prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his personal
injuries.*

**Dear all, please note that Team AutoPro Pte Ltd is GST registered w.e.f. 13th January
2021.

Best Regards,

David Seow

Team AutoPro Pte Ltd

Tel: 6258 1955 Fax: 6258 1956
Main Office: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #02-12 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722
Workshop/Survey Venue: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722

On Tue, Sep 7, 2021 at 2:34 PM MTPRI <MTPRI@smrt.com.sg> wrote:

Ref: TAX/09/21/2009

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sirs

We are the owner of SHC4731L as such we do not follow the new protocol.



Attached is a copy of our insurers, MS First Capital Insurance Limited's letter for your perusal.
Please let us have workshop contacts so our surveyor may call them to arrange for PRI without further delay.

Thank you.

However, we have 10 surveyors for you to choose from :-

1. M/s LKK Bryan Ang Tani

2. M/s LKK Adrian Ling Wai Ping

3. M/s LKK Kenneth Kong Seng Cheong
4. M/s LKK Marcus Chua Kang Seng

5. M/s LKK Mohammed Rasul Bin Mohd Yunus
6. M/s LKK Mohamad Taufikh Bin Hamid
7. M/s LKK Xing Guo Qiang

8. M/s LKK Steve Chen Tsue Yee

9. M/s LKK Lim Teow Guan

10. In House Low Thian Seng

Regards,

Hua Yen

Claim Department

Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd | 60 Woodlands Industrial Park E4 Singapore 757705
DID: 6866 2650 | Fax: 6368 7421 | Email: Huayen.Ong@strides.com.sg

From: Harminder Kaur [mailto:Harminder@msfirstcapital.com.sg]
Sent: 07 September 2021 14:29




To: MTPRI

Cc: Ong Hua Yen (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd); Merina Chia; teamautopl@gmail.com

Subject: NR PRI D21/2524M/SMRT/SS 2 Days Notice: SJF 7482 X (Our Ref) and SHC 4731 L (Your Ref) 3rd Party:
FIRST CAPITAL Dated 06/09/2021

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of SMRT. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognise the sender
and are expecting the content or attachment.

Dear Hua Yen,

PRI

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Harminder Kaur

Motor Claims

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd

A Member of EEEN

Insurance Group

36 Robinson Road, #16-01 City House, Singapore 068877 | Tel: 6507 3848 | Fax: 6507 3849 |Reg. No. 195000106C
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):

Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to
whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in
error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail.



From: TeamAutoPro North <teamautopl@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 7 September 2021 12:59 PM

To: Comfort Delgro TAXI <fleetsafety(@cdgtaxi.com.sg>; CWS Motor Claims
<cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>;
SBS Bus Claims <claimscontrol@comfortdelgro.com>

Subject: 2 Days Notice: SJF 7482 X (Our Ref) and SHC 4731 L (Your Ref) 3rd Party: FIRST CAPITAL
Dated 06/09/2021

Dear Sir/Madam,
Road Traffic Accident Involving SJF 7482 X (Our Ref) and SHC 4731 L (Your Ref)
Dated 06" September 2021, Time around 2130HRS

@ Along Lentor Avenue

We represent our client; RAJENDRAN RAMESH, to notify you of the aforesaid road traffic accident involving
our client‘s vehicle registration number: SJF 7482 X and your insured’s vehicle registration number: SHC
4731 L.

Enclosed herewith a copy of the Singapore Accident Statement filed for your reference.

Please let us know within 2 working days from today your agreeing to the above otherwise kindly send us your list of at
least ten (10) motor surveyors, via_

Contact Person |Eric Lee 8879 9997
Email Address teamautopl@gmail.com
Survey Address [160 Sin Ming Dr, #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722

Thank you for your attention to this email and we look forward to your earliest reply.

*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall
not prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his personal
injuries.*



**Dear all, please note that Team AutoPro Pte Ltd is GST registered w.e.f. 13th January
2021.

Best Regards,

David Seow

Team AutoPro Pte Ltd

Tel: 6258 1955 Fax: 6258 1956
Main Office: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #02-12 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722

Workshop/Survey Venue: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722



