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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: LEE KATIE <katielee@uoi.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 16 September 2021 5:03 PM

To: VAuG Claims

Cc: WONG JOSEPHINE; Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: GBL1879M - UOI OD - DOA: 06/09/2021 - Undertake Repair

Dear Raymond, 
 
Thanks.  As spoken with Vincent short while ago, please proceed with the repair at S$39,000 on 
lump sum basis. 
 
 
Dear Veron, 
 
Kindly liaise with Vin’s Auto to finalise the survey report.   Thanks. 
 
 
 
Notice 
 
Due to the COVID-19 situation, most of our staff are working from home.  While we remain committed to serving you, there may be 
delay in our customer services.  We thank you for your kind understanding under such challenging circumstances. 
 
 
 

Regards, 

Katie Lee 
Senior Manager 
Claims  

 

United Overseas Insurance Limited 

146 Robinson Road, #02-01, UOI Building, Singapore 068909    
Main  • (65) 6222 7733 | DID • (65) 6490 9318  | Fax • (65) 6327 3872  |  Email • katielee@uoi.com.sg 

 
UOI EMAIL DISCLAIMER 
Any person receiving this email and any attachment(s) contained, shall treat the information as confidential and not misuse, copy, 
disclose, distribute or retain the information in any way that amounts to a breach of confidentiality. If you are not the intended recipient, 
please delete all copies of this email from your computer system. As the integrity of this message cannot be guaranteed, neither UOI 
nor any entity in the UOI Group shall be responsible for the contents. Any opinion in this email may not necessarily represent the 
opinion of UOI or any entity in the UOI Group. 

 

From: VAuG Claims <claims@vinsautogroup.com.sg>  

Sent: Thursday, 16 September 2021 4:59 PM 

To: LEE KATIE <katielee@uoi.com.sg> 

Cc: WONG JOSEPHINE <josephinewong@uoi.com.sg> 

Subject: GBL1879M - UOI OD - DOA: 06/09/2021 - Undertake Repair 
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CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you 

recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

 

Good afternoon, 
 
We are able to undertake the repair @ $39000 before excess and GST 
 
It will take roughly 21 working days to finish repair 
 
We will also provide 1 year warranty after the repair 
 
Initially, we liaise with the person 9797 3968, this person will go on leave from tomorrow 
 
Please contact Brenda Sim 97995800 which is one of the boss of the company 
 
Thanks! 
Best Regards 
Raymond Teo 

To help protect your privacy, Microsoft Office prevented automatic download of this picture from the Internet.

 
Sin Ming AutoCity 

160 Sin Ming Drive 

Singapore 575722 

Showroom/Office: #03-03 

Workshops: #08-08/09/10 

Tel: 64532121 (4 lines) 

Fax: 64599795 

Website: www.vinsautogroup.com.sg 
Email: claims@vinsautogroup.com.sg 
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** w.e.f 15th May 2017, we have shifted location! ** 

** w.e.f 20th November 2017, we have changed our email address! ** 


