Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 5 October 2021 9:45 AM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto); VAuUG Claims
Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: GBL1879M - UOI OD - Finalization

Dear Raymond,

Lump Sum $39,000 confirmed before excess $500 @ 14 working days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 1 October 2021 9:44 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: VAuUG Claims <claims@vinsautogroup.com.sg>
Subject: GBL1879M - UOI OD - Finalization

Hi Veron,

The above vehicle repair done. Kindly assist.

Thanks.

Best Regards,
Steven Foong| Automotive Assessor



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@Ikkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: VAuG Claims <claims@vinsautogroup.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 1 October 2021 4:14 pm

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: GBL1879M - UOI OD - Finalization

Good afternoon,
We will close the case @ $39000 before Excess and GST
Thanks!

Best Regards
Raymond Teo

Sin Ming AutoCity

160 Sin Ming Drive

Singapore 575722

Showroom/Office: #03-03
Workshops: #08-08/09/10

Tel: 64532121 (4 lines)

Fax: 64599795

Website: www.vinsautogroup.com.sg
Email: claims@vinsautogroup.com.sg

Follow us on :

(OO ¥]in

** w.e.f 15th May 2017, we have shifted location! **
** w.e.f 20th November 2017, we have changed our email address! **



