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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Sent: Thursday, 11 November 2021 2:18 pm
To: KOH_WEI_LIANG@HOTMAIL.COM
Subject: <STANDARD NOTIFICATION LETTER> OUR REF: CC4/AIG21009310/Bgs3 *** ACCIDENT 

INVOLVING SJL 9920D & FBS 3360S ON 26/08/2021 ***

Our Ref:  CC4/AIG21009310/Bgs3 
                
11 NOVEMBER 2021 
 
Mr Koh Wei Liang 
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJL 9920D & FBS 3360S ON 26/08/2021 
 
We refer to the above accident. We are the Appointed Surveyor and Loss Adjuster Company by your Motor Insurer 
(AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd) to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto 
Insurance policy taken up with them. 
 
This is to inform you that we received a Third-Party Claim from FBS 3360S. 
                
Based on the accident report and accident scenario and pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or 
your authorized driver had amongst other information given us your version of how the accident had occurred 
together with your police investigation result that has submitted to us.  
 
We have reviewed the matter and come to a closure on the investigation and that we are in the review that 
liability is not in Third Party favor and that we have rejected Third Party claim against your vehicle insurance policy. 
 
You may proceed with your counter claim against Third Party’s vehicle insurance policy.  
 
Please call us if you have further queries. 
 
c.c.         AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd            
            (Motor Claims Dept) 
 
 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the 
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this 
negotiation of terms/settlement. 
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of 
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
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Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be 
made via email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any 
inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
 
Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 
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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Su Li (LKK Auto)
Sent: Thursday, 11 November 2021 9:49 am
To: Loh, Chee-Heng; Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: Re: 3682913653SG-003 LKK REF : CC4/AIG21009310/Bgs3

 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sir / Madam,  
 
Thank you for your email. 
 
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course. 
 
Hi , 
 
FYNA, CC4/AIG21009310/Bgs3 
 
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 
  
  
*Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission 
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
                                                               

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Su Li| Admin Support 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
 
 

From: Loh, Chee-Heng <Chee-Heng.Loh@aig.com> 
Sent: Thursday, November 11, 2021 9:30 AM 
To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: 3682913653SG-003  
  
Hi, 
  
In view of the PIR against TP rider, kindly proceed to reject claim.  
  
Kindly upload correspondence to insured into Merimen.  
  
Thank you. 
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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Sent: Thursday, 11 November 2021 2:09 pm
To: 'management@assist.com.sg'
Subject: RE: FBS3360S
Attachments: OI PIR.pdf

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Ray, 
 
We refer to the above matter 
 
Attached is a copy of our insured PIR result.  
 
Your client is charged with careless driving.  
 
In view of above, we have our principal instruction to deny liability and not able to look into this matter.  
 
Thanks  
 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the 
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this 
negotiation of terms/settlement. 
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of 
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be 
made via email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any 
inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
 
Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 
 
 
 

From: Management Assist <management@assist.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, 22 October 2021 10:35 AM 


