Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Soon Hoo Loo <soonhoo®@lioncityrentals.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 24 February 2023 6:53 PM

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Cc: Icrarc@lioncityrentals.com.sg

Subject: Re: FW: (Gentle Reminder) SLH6863C Estimate

PROPERTY CLAIM
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

TO : ANY PERSONAL INJURY
CLAIMS

Dear Sir/Madam,
We are pleased to inform you that we are agreeable to your proposed repair cost of $1,500.00 (before GST) at 4 working days for vehicle number SLH6863C.

Thank you.

Regards,
Loo Soon Hoo

Lion City Rentals Pte Ltd

On Tue, Feb 7, 2023 at 2:24 PM Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair of LS $1,500.00 with 4 days of repair, subject to their approval.

Best Regards,
Huey Yon | case handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Fax: 62564315 email: hueyyon@Ikkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, Singapore 408933

& A1 Soon Hoo Loo <soonhoo@lioncityrentals.com.sg>

BA&#%: 20224 10H 14H 18:11:12 (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore
ek A: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com>




#3%: Lion City Rentals ARC <|crarc@lioncityrentals.com.sg>
F & Re: (Gentle Reminder) SLH6863C Estimate

PROPERTY CLAIM
WITHOUT PREJUDICE
TO : ANY PERSONAL INJURY

CLAIMS

Dear Sir/Madam,
Here is a gentle reminder that we are awaiting your recommended cost of repair and days of repair.

Thank you.

Regards,

Loo Soon Hoo

Lion City Rentals Pte Ltd

On Mon, Oct 3, 2022 at 4:48 PM Soon Hoo Loo <soonhoo@lioncityrentals.com.sg> wrote:

PROPERTY CLAIM
WITHOUT PREJUDICE
TO : ANY PERSONAL INJURY

CLAIMS

Dear Sir/Madam,
As requested, attached are the pictures for SLH6863C. We shall await your recommended cost of repair and days of repair.

Thank you.

Regards,
Loo Soon Hoo

Lion City Rentals Pte Ltd



