Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 7 October 2021 3:09 PM
To: SUR; Jenny Lim

Subject: FW: SMU 5040L

Attachments: SMU 5040L-Audatex Report.pdf
Dear Jenny,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Confirmed finalise amount $1,062.60 (before GST).

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Jenny Lim [mailto:jenny.lim@laihuat.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 7 October 2021 2:35 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: SMU 5040L

Dear Veron

The finalise amount $1,062.60 (before GST).
Thank you.

Kind regards.

Jenny Lim

for LAI HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTE LTD
160 Sin Ming Drive

#04-01, #04-02 & #07-03

Sin Ming Autocity

Singapore 575722

Tel: 64538110

Fax: 64596267



