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Re: REQUEST FINALISED FOR PC 5492A TOYOTA HIACE COMMUTER 3.0GL A DOA
25.08.2021

Admin AP Automotive Services <mota@apautomotive.services>
Wed 25/5/2022 5:17 PM
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>;Juliana . <juliana@apautomotive.services>;Paul Ho
<paul@apautomotive.services>;Marcus Teo <marcus@apautosg.com>;Chrystia Liew
<chrystia@apautomotive.services>;info <info@apautosg.com>;ClickUp: PC 5492A <a.c.1teft89.u-37601221.22d00e38-a7fe-
4f30-ae5d-3b3ece54180f@tasks.clickup.com>

Dear Taufikh

We accepted the COR offer of $3,650.00 and 6 repair days.

We will submit the LOD as soon as possible.

Best regards,

Zaleha
AP Automotive  Services Pte Ltd
ROC: 202022890H
BLK 9006 TAMPINES ST 93
#01-202 TAMPINES INDUSTRIAL PARK A
SINGAPORE 528840
TEL: 6970 4786   FAX: 6787 4886

On Wed, 25 May 2022 at 16:51, Taufikh (LKK Auto) <taufikh@lkkauto.com> wrote:


Hi,

 

“Without Prejudice”

 

Please refer attached, we will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of L/S $3650/- with 6
days of repair, subject to their approval.

 

Regards

Taufikh

Lkk Auto
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From: Admin AP Automotive Services [mailto:mota@apautomotive.services] 

Sent: Monday, 14 February 2022 12:02 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Juliana .; Paul Ho; Marcus Teo; Nic Chia; info; Chrystia Liew

Subject: REQUEST FINALISED FOR PC 5492A TOYOTA HIACE COMMUTER 3.0GL A DOA 25.08.2021

 

Hi Sir / Madam

 

We seek your kind help if you could finalize the vehicle.

 

Kindly forward us the estimate with your marking.

 

Looking forward to hear from you soon.

 

Please do not hesitate to contact me should you have any queries thereof.

 

Best regards,

 

Zaleha

AP Automotive  Services Pte Ltd

ROC: 202022890H

BLK 9006 TAMPINES ST 93

#01-202 TAMPINES INDUSTRIAL PARK A

SINGAPORE 528840

TEL: 6970 4786   FAX: 6787 4886
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