




Po11cy No

C l aimar:rt

Amount

MOTOR DTSCHARGE VOUCHER

DMCVSNA00103052001 Claim No : SNM21D204925

HENG SENG LEE ET,ECTRICAL & PLUMBING CONTRACTOR

s$10,000 .77
SINGAPORE DOLLARS TEN THOUSAND AND CENTS SEVENTY SEVEN ONLY

I/We agree to accept the above mentioned amount to be paid to me/us
final settlement of a1l claims, costs & disbursements for lnjuries
sustained by me/us through an accident involving

in fu1l e

/ damages

Claimant Vehicle No. : GBL350C
Tnsureo Vehicle No. : YP4357P

Date of Loss : 25/08/2a21
Place of Accident : BKE WOODLANDS AT BUKIT PANJANG EXfT

iN CONSIDERATlON of the payment made to me/us of the aforementioned sum by
CHINA TAIPING fNSURANCtr (SINGAPORE) P?tr. LTD., I/We agree absolutel,y to
discharge CHINA TAIPING fNSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD. and/or

Insured Name
Driver Name

: WE MOVING SERVICES LIMITED LIABIL]TY PARTNtrRSHIP
: EDWIN CHEONG JIA FANG

from all claims, present or future in respect of all 1oss, injury
sustained by me/us arrsing oui of the said accidenL.

or damage

I acknowledge that this payment j-s made without admission of liability on the
part of CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD.

(1)

l2)
(3)
(4)

(s)
(6)

t])

General Damages
Cost of Repair:/E+<ees+
Loss of $se/RentaU€a:=*+*.q
@
@/Search Fees
Medical Reports/Expenses
Survey Fees/P.T. Eees/Towing
Cost including Disbursement

TOTAL

9.000.7?
1,000.00

s$ 10,000.77
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Clalmant Name :

[Eii6 5Elt6 tEE ErECl'RtCAt & pruMBiiJc
cONTRACIOR

BLK 37, DEFU LANE 1 0, #02.75

TEL: 6282 9758 FAX:628! 0076

e L4+ +6G u, J

prfagfz-szb

NRIC No :

DateSignature :
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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 9 February 2023 4:02 PM
To: wemovingservices@gmail.com
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP4357P(CHINA TAIPING) AND GBL350C AT/ ALONG BT. 

PANJANG EXIT 3 ON 25/08/2021

WE MOVING SERVICES LIMITED LIABILITY PARTNERSHIP                                              [By Email Only] 
DRIVER: EDWIN CHEONG JIA FANG 
  
Dear Sir/Madam, 
  
You Ref: YP4357P 
Our Ref: CC6/CTI21009164/Aga3 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP4357P(CHINA TAIPING) AND GBL350C AT/ ALONG BT. PANJANG EXIT 3 ON 25/08/2021 
  
We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor 
insurer, China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy. 
  
We have received a claim from GBL350C against your motor insurance policy. 
  
Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in your driver’s favour. 
Therefore, we shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement of the third party claim at best to avoid further 
litigation, which would escalate to even more cost. 
  
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact 
us within 07 days from the date of this letter. 
  
Thank you. 
 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 



5/28/23, 12:35 PM RE: [SEEK MANDATE] - Your ref: SNM21D204925 // LKK ref : CC6/CTI21009164/Apa3q2 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP435…

about:blank 1/2

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless
you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

RE: [SEEK MANDATE] - Your ref: SNM21D204925 // LKK ref :
CC6/CTI21009164/Apa3q2 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP4357P(CHINA TAIPING) AND
GBL350C(TP) ON 25/08/2021]

Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>
Wed 17/5/2023 9:48 AM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Dear Sir/Mdm,
 
Please proceed to offer repairer “J-MART MOTOR PTE LTD" at $10,000.77(all-in).
 
Regards,
 
Irene Tay
Claims Department (Motor Division)
 
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909 
DID: (65) 63896192   |   F:(65) 62247478/62247175
  
W: www.sg.cntaiping.com   |    FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/   |   WeChat: 太平狮城
Taiping SG
 
 
Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and
may contain confidential information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this
message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify
the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.
 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, March 13, 2023 10:09 AM
To: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>
Subject: [SEEK MANDATE] - Your ref: SNM21D204925 // LKK ref : CC6/CTI21009164/Apa3q2 [ACCIDENT
INVOLVING YP4357P(CHINA TAIPING) AND GBL350C(TP) ON 25/08/2021]
 

 

Your ref: SNM21D204925
LKK ref : CC6/CTI21009164/Apa3q2
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP4357P(CHINA TAIPING) AND GBL350C(TP) ON 25/08/2021
 
We refer to the above matter.
 

http://www.sg.cntaiping.com/
http://www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/


5/28/23, 12:35 PM RE: [SEEK MANDATE] - Your ref: SNM21D204925 // LKK ref : CC6/CTI21009164/Apa3q2 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP435…

about:blank 2/2

It is a head-to-rear collision. We are of the view that liability is not in our driver’s favour.
 
We seek your approval to offer repairer “J-MART MOTOR PTE LTD" at $10,000.77(all-in).
 
The summary is as follows: -
 

Amount Claimed Amount Revised
1. Cost of Repair (with 7% GST) $ 15,100.89 $ 9,000.77 ($8,411.93 + 7%GST)
2. Loss of RENTAL (10days x $120.00) $ 1,200.00 $ 1,000.00 (10DAYS X $100.00)

Total $ 16,300.89 $ 10,000.77
 
Surveyor recommended 9days for repair + 1SUNDAY = 10DAYS.
 
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.
 
Kindly note that this inspection report dated 10/03/2023 is only for mandate purpose.
 
Kindly let us have your approval / instruction.
 

 

 
Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)
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