1/10/22, 9:57 AM Merimen e-Claims

Print Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*$JT2130X (MFL2021D0004098)
[GBK3190H]
TP
KANG NYUK LIAN
Aug 30 2021 7:00AM

SM Automotive

From India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (IlI_SG), sent on 12/10/2021 09:11 AM.
To LKK_HQ
Subject Alert - Adj Mandate Maintained - SJT2130X - Claim Handler: Gabriel Wee

Maintained:Please inform workshop to re-direct the claim towards pan pac. They will settle the claim.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfim?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_Print&CFID=91051418&CFTOKEN=1700bf2f449fdcf3-8D6BAS8C...
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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: sm automotive <sm_automotive@hotmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 19 October 2021 1:16 pm

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: ACC INV SJT 2130X AND GBK 3190H ON 30.08.2021 *** LKK REF:
CC6/11121009163/Aga3

Attachments: SJT2130X PRIVATE SETTLEMENT FORM.pdf

Without Prejudice
Hi Cecilia
We would like to inform you that the matter settled as a private settlement and will close the case at our end.

Enclosed signed private settlement form for your reference, thanks.

Regards,

Sukyi Chong
SM AUTOMOTIVE

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6

Blk C #01-43

Singapore 417883

Tel: 6747 9241 Fax: 67417276

From: sm automotive <sm_automotive@hotmail.com>

Sent: Friday, October 8, 2021 2:37 PM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: ACC INV SJT 2130X AND GBK 3190H ON 30.08.2021 *** LKK REF: CC6/11121009163/Aga3
Without Prejudice

Hi Cecilia
Accident on 30.08.2021 @ 0730 hrs and vehicle surveyed by your good surveyor Adrian on 31.08.2021 and we
started to repair the vehicle without any further delay.

The mutual settlement is felled on the 13.09.2021 and by installment plan, refer attached.

Regards,



