9/3/21, 1:43 PM Mail - Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) - Outlook

Re: Claim Notification - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKV 1488Z(AIG) AND SME 2136Z
AT/ALONG YISHUN RING ROAD JUNCTION OF YISHUN AVE 4 ON 14/08/2021

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Fri 3/9/2021 1:43 PM

To: Eng Soon Gan <engsoon_gan@yahoo.com>

[ﬂJ 1 attachments (396 KB)
Mutual Settlement Form(SKV1488Z & SME2136Z7) (1).pdf;

Hi Mr Gan,

Attached is a copy of mutual settlement form signed by both parties.
We will proceed to close file at our end.

Thank you.

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 3 September 2021 1:31 pm

To: Eng Soon Gan <engsoon_gan@yahoo.com>

Subject: Re: Claim Notification - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKV 1488Z(AIG) AND SME 2136Z AT/ALONG YISHUN
RING ROAD JUNCTION OF YISHUN AVE 4 ON 14/08/2021

Hi Mr Gan,

Received with thanks.
We will forward you a copy after third party had signed on it.
Thank you.

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Eng Soon Gan <engsoon_gan@yahoo.com>

Sent: Friday, 3 September 2021 1:23 pm

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Claim Notification - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKV 1488Z(AIG) AND SME 2136Z AT/ALONG YISHUN

RING ROAD JUNCTION OF YISHUN AVE 4 ON 14/08/2021
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MUTUAL SETTLEMENT FORM AI G
FOR MOTOR ACCIDENT

L -

1. WE, THE UNDERSIGNED HEREBY AGREE TO MUTUALLY SETTLE AMONG OURSELVES A MOTOR ACCIDENT

AS FOLLOWS:
Date / Time: 14/08/2021@12:37PM
Along: YISHUN RING ROAD JUNCTION OF YISHUN AVE 4
Involving Vehicle Number(s): SKWV14887 & SMEZ2136Z2

2. BOTH PARTIES HAVE AGREED TO SETTLE THIS MATTER AMICABLY AS FOLLOWS:

*Delete (A) and [B) as applicable.

(A) Neither party shall be liable to compensate the party for any loss or damages (direct or indirect) incurred or to

be incurred as a result of the accident.
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Signature: @ . Signature:
Name:  Gan Eng Soon Name: ) ee Kay Kay
Address: Blk 850 Yishun St 81 Address:
#07-104, Singapore 750850
Vehicle No.: SKV1488Z Vehicle No.: SME21367
Contact No.: 96788460 Contact No.:
Date: Date:
3/9/2021

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

AIG Building 78 Shenton Way #07-16 Singapore 079120

Tel: 6419 3000

Co. Reg. No. 201009404M Copyright © 2015 AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. All rights reserved.

Sent by ES Gan

On 3 Sep 2021, at 1:04 PM, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote:
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Hi Mr Gan,

As per our tele-conversation, third party agreed to do mutual settlement which means both
parties not claiming against each other's.

Kindly assist sign on the form and return back to us for our further action.

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.
Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much
regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 2 September 2021 3:44 pm

To: engsoon_gan@yahoo.com <engsoon_gan@yahoo.com>

Subject: Claim Notification - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKV 1488Z(AIG) AND SME 2136Z AT/ALONG
YISHUN RING ROAD JUNCTION OF YISHUN AVE 4 ON 14/08/2021

02 Sept 2021

Mr Gan Eng Soon [By Email Only]
Driver: Gan SuBin

Dear Sir/Madam,

You Ref: SKV14882

Our Ref: CC4/A1G21009143/ps3

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKV 1488Z(AIG) AND SME 2136Z AT/ALONG YISHUN RING ROAD
JUNCTION OF YISHUN AVE 4 ON 14/08/2021

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are
the loss adjuster appointed by your motor insurer, AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. to deal
with the third-party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from SME2136Z against your insurance policy.

Based on all the available information on hand, we are of the view that the case would be
settled at equal liability as both parties were changing lane. Under Motor Accident Guide, both
vehicles should exercise caution when changing lanes. Therefore, we will proceed to negotiate
for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

If you have evidence/information to proof that we should not settle the third-party claim, kindly
let us have them in writing within the next 10 days i.e. by 14/09/2021, after we shall proceed
with negotiation with Third Party claimant on the without prejudice basis and any settlement
should not bind any claims whatsoever by you/your driver against the other party’s insurer
arising from this particular accident.
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Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected upon next renewal due to
this Third-Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed
utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.
Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much
regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
<Mutual Settlement Form(SKV1488Z & SME2136Z).pdf>
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