Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 14 September 2021 10:31 AM
To: ‘carsmithpl’

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: GBA 5870T FINALISED

Hi Alex,

LOD send to insurance.

Regards
Taufikh

From: carsmithpl [mailto:carsmithpl@gmail.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 14 September 2021 10:10 AM
To: Taufikh (LKK Auto)

Cc: 'Veron Chen (LKKAuto)'

Subject: Re: GBA 5870T FINALISED

Hi Taufikh,
ok accept COR $2500 and 5days .

may i know LOD sent to ur or insurance?

alex beh

On 14/9/2021 12:00 am, Taufikh (LKK Auto) wrote:
Hi Alex,

COR based on repair limit, lumpsum $2500, 5 days.
Regards

Taufikh
Lkk Auto



