Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Gary Teh <gary.g.teh@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 8 September 2021 3:54 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMM 9806K AND SJJ 6118J ON 28/08/2020 06:30

ALONG /AT CAR PARK AT EAST COAST PARK

Hi Asher,

Certificate of Insurance attached.



MERCEDES-BENZ MO
Name of Policyholder : TE

Period of Insurance 20

Engine No. « 20

Chassis No. : WI
ABOUT THE COVER
Make/Model N
Engine Capacity/Tonnage : 1
Driver Restriction N
Person or Classes of Persons




Cheers,
Gary

On Wed, 8 Sep 2021 at 3:27 PM, Gary Teh <gary.g.teh@gmail.com> wrote:
Pls find attached my Malaysia driving license.
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Kenderaan Orang Cacat (Motosikal) BTR
Invalid Carmiage (Motor Cycle) unladen v

Kenderaan Orang Cacat (Motokar) BTM
Invalid Carriage (Motor Car) uniladen we

Motosikal melebihi 500 sp
Motor Cycle exceeding 500 cc

Motosikal tidak melebihi 500 sp
Motor Cycle not exceeding 500 cc

Motosikal tidak melebihi 250 sp
Motor Cycle not exceeding 250 cc

Motosikal Tiga Roda
Three Wheels Mator Cycle

Motokar BTM tidak melebihi 3500 kg
Motor Car unladen weight not exceedin,

Motokar Tanpa Pedal Klac BTM tidak m
Motor Car Without Ciutch Pedal unla
3500 kg

Motokar Berat BTM melebihi 7500 kg
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Regards,
Gary

On Wed, 8 Sep 2021 at 1:37 PM, Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ilkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Mr The,

Thank you for the information.

We will follow up the matter with our principal.

Please be informed that we are currently deployed to work from home in view of the current COVID-19 situation may
reach me at 8839 9816 for any urgent matters.

Thank You.

Best Regards,
Asher Sng | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 | did: 6841-6051

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: Gary Teh <gary.g.teh@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 8 September 2021 12:03 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMM 9806K AND SJJ 6118) ON 28/08/2020 06:30 ALONG /AT CAR PARK AT
EAST COAST PARK

Hi Asher,



| have submitted the report through aig.com.sg

Cheers,

Gary Teh

On Mon, 6 Sep 2021 at 10:59 AM, Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Mr Teh,

We refer to the email below.

We have no information on the amount of damaged to the third party as the vehicle yet to send in for inspection
due to non reporting.

Kindly assist to file the GIA report and we shall revert to third party to arrange on the necessary.

Please be informed that we are currently deployed to work from home in view of the current COVID-19 situation may
reach me at 8839 9816 for any urgent matters.

Thank You.

Best Regards,
Asher Sng | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 | did: 6841-6051

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.



From: Gary Teh <gary.g.teh@gmail.com>

Sent: Saturday, 4 September 2021 1:43 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMM 9806K AND SJJ 6118J ON 28/08/2020 06:30 ALONG /AT CAR PARK AT
EAST COAST PARK

Hi,

| agree that | have been careless and accidentally revised into SJJ6118J which is parking at rest. My right bumper
may have touched the left front of his car. It was early in the morning and quite dark. At the time of the incident,
we did not noticed any damage. We exchanged contact detail and | told Kok Wei that | would be happy to
compensate for damages (if any).

Could you pls let me know the damage to SHI6118J. | would like to consider paying out of pocket instead if
damage is not substantial.

| have attached photos of the back of my car for reference as well.

Pls feel free to contact me at 9761 9197.

best regards,

Gary












On Wed, 1 Sep 2021 at 5:17 PM, Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

LKK REF: CC3/A1G21009081/ea3

AIG REF: TP / 6818402497SG

TEH GHEE GHEE

3 WEST COAST DRIVE

03-16

SINGAPORE 128021

Dear Sirs,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMM 9806K AND S]] 6118] ON 28/08/2020 06:30 ALONG /AT CAR PARK AT
EAST COAST PARK

We, LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd has been appointed to act on the behalf of your insurer, AIG Asia Pacific
Insurance Pte Ltd (AIG) to settle a THIRD PARTY claim against you for an accident which happened on the
above-mentioned date and location.

Kindly proceed to lodge your GIA report within five (05) working days of receipt of this letter, giving the
version of the accident amongst other things related to the accident. The GIA report can be lodged at any of
AlG reporting centers. You may refer to your Certificate of Insurance for the list of the reporting centers.

If you have any information to add or any amendments to make, please contact the undersigned within five
days from the date of this letter.

Please note that the standing of your insurance policy such as NCD, premium & etc. would be affected.

Yours faithfully,
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s

Asher Sng
Claims
Tel: 6841 6051

Fax: 6741 4108

Email : AsherSng@lkkauto.com

c.c Claims Manager
AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd

(Motor Claims Dept)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via
email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much
regretted.
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