Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Hi Kenneth

EM Auto <emautosolution@singnet.com.sg>
Tuesday, 5 October 2021 1:49 PM

Veron Chen (LKKAuto); Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)
Derek

RE: GBK 1969S-DOA :26.8.21

Confirmed COR $16,500.00 — 12 working days.

Regards.

Sirina

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Monday, 4 October, 2021 3:26 PM
To: EM Auto <emautosolution@singnet.com.sg>

Subject: GBK 1969S-DOA :26.8.21

Dear Sirina,

Attach surveyor mark estimate

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



