Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 18 October 2021 3:36 PM
To: Thomas.Pang@borneomotors.com.sg
Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: Finalize Report YQ2387K

Dear Thomas,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Confirm final fig $6,505.20 before excess $800.00 & GST and 6 repair days.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Thomas Pang PTCBC <Thomas.Pang@borneomotors.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 13 October 2021 2:18 pm

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Finalize Report YQ2387K

Dear Steve,

Attach finalize report for your perusal.. 06 working days.
Thank you

Regards

Thomas Pang



