Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 29 September 2021 2:21 PM

To: Vikneswaran Naidu

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); anson.seah@bisauto.com.sg
Subject: SJW 9199L

Attachments: SJW 9199 marked estimate.pdf

Hi Vicky,

Kindly refer the attached file, marked estimate for cost 10%.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@Ilkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Vikneswaran Naidu <vicky@bisauto.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 29 September 2021 1:21 pm

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>; anson.seah@bisauto.com.sg <anson.seah@bisauto.com.sg>
Subject: RE: SJW 9199L

Dear Steve,

Above attached the revised estimate for the Vehicle including the check itemé& supplementary parts. Kindly go through
the estimate and send me revised quote.

Thank you
Best Regards

BIS Automobiles Pte Ltd

Vikneswaran Naidu
Senior Customer Service Advisor



30 Teban Gardens Crescent
Singapore 608927

Main: +65 6896 3933
Fax: +65 6561 1763

Website : https://www.bmw.com.sg/en/topics/fascination-bmw/about-BIS.html

Facebook : https://www.facebook.com/BMWBIS

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) [mailto:SteveChen@Ilkkauto.com]
Sent: Monday, August 30, 2021 3:53 PM

To: vicky@bisauto.com.sg

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: SJW 9199L

Hi Vicky,

As per discussion and survey by today. The subject vehicle more than 3 years from Registration date. Our
report will deduct Lumpsum basis. Unable repair part-by-part basis.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@Ikkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




