Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 28 January 2022 2:49 PM

To: Syed-Yusoff, Saliha

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: AIG Ref: 4309605533SG // LKK Ref: CC4/A1G21009002/ps3 [Accident Involving
SDY9363P(AlG) and SKW4326H on 21/08/2021]

Attachments: AIG_LKKInvoice1 _ AC2200607.pdf

Hi Saliha,

Attached is a copy of Merimen fee invoice for your necessary action.

Thank you.

"Wishing You Happiness & Prosperity Chinese New Year 2022"

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 26 January 2022 1:39 PM

To: Syed-Yusoff, Saliha <Saliha.Syed-Yusoff @aig.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: AIG Ref: 4309605533SG // LKK Ref: CC4/A1G21009002/ps3 [Accident Involving SDY9363P(AIG) and
SKW4326H on 21/08/2021]

Hi Saliha,

Please be informed that third party did not repair at Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd(see attached) and no survey was
conducted by LKK.

We will proceed to close file at our end and submit bill for Merimen fee soon.

Thank you.

"Wishing You Happiness & Prosperity Chinese New Year 2022"



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S(408933)




