Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Ramesh <Ramesh@goldbell.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 22 October 2021 4:48 pm

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto); Catherine Chong Kai Ling

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SCA16P ON 23 AUGUST 2021 ALONG PIE

(SNM21D204669/C01/SCA16P/TOHHS)

Dear Shiau Chan,

SCA16P was Constructive Total Loss by China Taiping Insurance.

Regards.

GOLDBELL Goldbell Lngineering Pte Ltd

comse. CENGINEERING

Industrial Vehicles. Financial Services.
41,000 Served, And Counting. +65 6864 0695 | +65 8157 8014 | f: +65 6863 0425 | www.goldbell.com.sg

Distribution | Leasing | Financial Services | Tech-enabled Core | Venture Build | Investments | Accelerator

WE'RE MORE THAN JUST INDUSTRIAL VEHICLES.
WE'RE AN ECOSYSTEM THAT CONNECTS EVERYONE. e

GOLDBELL

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 22 October 2021 4:35 pm

To: Ramesh <Ramesh@goldbell.com.sg>; Catherine Chong Kai Ling <CatherineChongKL@goldbell.com.sg>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SCA16P ON 23 AUGUST 2021 ALONG PIE (SNM21D204669/C01/SCA16P/TOHHS)

Dear Sir/Madam,

Kindly advise the status of SCA 16P.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@I|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 14 September 2021 10:57 am

To: Joyce Chng <joycechng52@gmail.com>; catherine lim <catherine@junshi.com.sg>

Cc: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Pauline Tham
<pauline.tham@sg.cntaiping.com>; Ramesh <Ramesh@goldbell.com.sg>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

1



<siewsc@l|kkauto.com>; Chee So Chow <sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com>
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SCA16P ON 23 AUGUST 2021 ALONG PIE (SNM21D204669/C01/SCA16P/TOHHS)

CLAIM NO: SNM21D204669/C01/SCA16P/TOHHS

M/S QUEK HOCK SENG CONSTRUCTION PTE LTD
ATTN: MS JOYCE CHNG

Dear Ms Joyce Chng
We are in receipt of your email and contents duly noted.

Our successful wreck buyer will liaise with your good office on the settlement on claim.

NOTICE :

In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as
delay is to be expected for handling hardcopy documents. All correspondence should be made via email
claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards

Alfred Toh
Senior Executive
Claims Department
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com
W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: X Jifits; TaipingSG
Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may
contain confidential information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in
whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Please
delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Joyce Chng <joycechng52 @gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, September 14, 2021 10:21 AM
To: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SCA16P ON 23 AUGUST 2021 ALONG PIE (SNM21D204669/C01/SCA16P/TOHHS)

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Hi Alfred Toh,

We, QueK Hock Seng Construction Pte Ltd confirmed and accept total loss.
Thank you.

Joyce

Quek Hock Seng Construction Pte Ltd
13/9/2021



