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转发: SJW2793S

Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com>
Wed 29/9/2021 9:36 AM
To:  SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>

 

发件人: Xin Yun Auto <xinyunauto1@gmail.com>

已发送: 2021年9月29日 9:36:22 (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore

收件人: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com>

主题: Re: SJW2793S


Thanks alot Guo Qiang.

Best Regards,
Yi Xin
Xin Yun Auto
Tel/Fax:6634 0858
Mobile: 9839 1555
Email:xinyunauto1@gmail.com

On Tue, Sep 28, 2021 at 8:30 PM Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Yi Xin,
 
Finalize COR $5000 before GST @ 6 days.
COR subject to insurance approval.

 
Regards,
Guo Qiang





发件人: Xin Yun Auto <xinyunauto1@gmail.com>

发送时间: 2021年9月20日 16:04

收件人: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com>

主题: Re: SJW2793S
 
Hi Guo Qiang, please let me have the marking and your finalise, thank you.


Best Regards,
Yi Xin
Xin Yun Auto
Tel/Fax:6634 0858
Mobile: 9839 1555
Email:xinyunauto1@gmail.com
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