
 
Yr ref : CC6/CTI21008714/Kba3 
Our ref: JO202108-0752 
       WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
15th September 2021 
 

 Dear Sir/Mdm, 
 

  CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTE LTD 
NO. 3 
ANSON RD 
SPRINGLEAF TOWER 
SINGAPORE 079909 
 

Accident involving GBL3305P and SMN9159P on 17/08/2021 
 

We refer to the above said accident. 
 

We enclosed herewith relevant documents as stated below:- 
 

1) Repair tax invoice 
2) Letter of authorization 
3) GIA search receipt 
4) Rental agreement 

 
As instructed, we are claiming the following as stated below:- 
 
1) Cost of repair          $              1,739.23 
2) Loss of Rental (3Days x $104.00)                        $                 312.00 
3) GIA search fee          $                     2.00 
        Total     $             2,053.23 
  
We do not have the survey report and photographs as our client’s motor vehicle was 
surveyed by your appointed surveyor. 
 

Please kindly let us know whether you are prepared to settle our client’s claim & we 
look forward to hear from you soonest.   
 

Thanks & regards 
 
 
 ____________ 
Vronica Law (Claim dept.) 
Tel: 6453 1235 
Fax: 6453 7944 
Email: cityauto@singnet.com.sg  



M

/

LUMENS AUTO PTE LTD

19/08/202119/08/2021





BLK 8, SIN MING IND. ESTATE, #01-60/62, SIN MING ROAD, SINGAPORE 575643
TEL: 6453 1235, 6452 0850 FAX: 6453 7944
24hrs Towing Services Tel: 9823 9898
Co. Reg. No.: 199503435C GST Reg. No.: M2-8920979-4

TAX INVOICE
Tax Invoice :CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTE LTD I202109-000597

SMN9159P
TOYOTA PRIUS PLUS (AUTO):

15/09/2021NO. 3
ANSON RD
SPRINGLEAF TOWER
SINGAPORE 079909

:

:
Make / Model

Date

Vehicle No.

Chassis No. :

Accident Date :
Claim No. :
Reference :

Policy No. :

JO202108-0752

20-ML000510-R00

JTDZS3EU30J047063

17/08/2021
CC6/CTI21008714/Kba3

Contact : 62222366 Fax No. : 62247175
182173Mileage (km) :Attention: MOTOR CLAIM DEPARTMENT

Particular Quantity Unit Price Amount

S$ S$

S/No.

LIST ITEMS :
Rear bumper (upper) 1.01 523.90523.90
Rear bumper (lower) 1.02 849.89849.89

Rear Bumper clips 12.03 24.002.00

Rear bumper retainer 1.04 142.80142.80

25% Discount S$ :
1,540.59

385.14
List Total : 

1,155.45

LABOUR :
- To install reverse sensor 50.0050.00
-To knock jackout damaged parts, panel beating,welding, align, refix 
and to renew accident parts

200.00200.00

- Spray painting on affected & replace parts 220.00220.00

470.00LABOUR Total S$: 

:Total S$ 1,625.45

CASH / NETS / CREDIT CARD PAYMENT ONLY

GST @ 7% S$

Grand Total S$

:

:

113.78

1,739.23

for CITY AUTO PTE LTD  Customer's Signature/Co. Stamp  

Please note all works performed by City Auto Pte Ltd as performed in this invoice is subjected to the following Warranty 
conditions:
1) Any replacement of electrical components will carry 1 month warranty period from date of this invoice.
2) Any replacement of mechanical components will carry  3 months warranty period.
Please note that all warranty does not cover wear and tear conditions regardless of any components.
City Auto Pte Ltd reserves the right to determine any warranty conditions.

Thank You For Your Business !
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Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMN 9159P AND GBL 3305P ON THE 17/08/2021

Collection Wee's <weescollection@gmail.com>
Thu 10/21/2021 4:32 PM
To:  Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>
Cc:  Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Hi Jaslin,

Noted with thanks and have a good weekend ahead.

Regards,
David

Get Outlook for Android

From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, October 21, 2021 4:19:32 PM

To: weescollection@gmail.com <weescollection@gmail.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMN 9159P AND GBL 3305P ON THE 17/08/2021
 
Dear David

We noted your concern regarding the repair cost.

As reported, it is a head-to-rear collision. Vehicles are designed to absorb impact energy rather than to resist
energy within the impact force limits. Compared to the rear portion, the front portion of a vehicle is usually
stronger and tougher as the front portion houses most of the mechanical & electrical components like engine.
 
Our surveyor had physically conducted survey to third party vehicle and is in the view that the damages
sustained to the Third-Party vehicle is consistent to the nature of accident as reported. The adjusted repair
cost to third party vehicle is at $1,625.45(before GST).
 
The repair cost includes replacement of Rear bumper, Rear Tailgate, Rear logo, bumper sponge, Reverse
sensor and Labour charges to re-spray, remove, repair and renews affected areas etc.
 
We attached here with the damage photos during our inspection for your easy reference.
 
Please be informed that the amount is not yet finalized.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

 
From: Collection Wee's <weescollection@gmail.com> 

Sent: Wednesday, 1 September 2021 11:00 AM


https://aka.ms/AAb9ysg
mailto:JaslinKok@lkkauto.com


10/21/21, 7:35 PM Mail - Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) - Outlook

https://outlook.office.com/mail/AAMkAGY5MjA5NjAxLWUzOTktNDAzMi1hNmYyLWQzMjg1MjhjYjA2OQAuAAAAAAApXOAAHQAETpD51vZ3XBi… 2/2

To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMN 9159P AND GBL 3305P ON THE 17/08/2021
 
Hi Jasper,
 
Noted, may we check on the damage cost?
 
Regards,
David
 
Get Outlook for Android

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, September 1, 2021 10:44:54 AM

To: WEESCOLLECTION@GMAIL.COM <WEESCOLLECTION@GMAIL.COM>

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMN 9159P AND GBL 3305P ON THE 17/08/2021
 
Our Ref: CC6/CTI21008714/Kba3
 
01 SEPTEMBER 2021                                                                                                             
 
WEE'S COLLECTION
Driver : DAVID WEE SOON JIN
 
Dear Sir/Madam,
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMN 9159P AND GBL 3305P ON THE 17/08/2021
 
We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve
the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.
 
We have received a claim from Body Repairer/Workshop acting on behalf of the owner of SMN 9159P against
your motor insurance policy.
               
Based on the accident report, accident scenario and evidence at hand, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.
 
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please
contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.
 
Please call us if you have further queries.
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. 
Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much
regretted.
 

Best Regards,

Jasper Chua| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.
 

 

https://aka.ms/AAb9ysg
mailto:jasperchua@lkkauto.com
mailto:WEESCOLLECTION@GMAIL.COM
mailto:WEESCOLLECTION@GMAIL.COM
mailto:jasperchua@lkkauto.com


12/27/21, 10:22 AM Mail - Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) - Outlook

https://outlook.office.com/mail/id/AAMkAGY5MjA5NjAxLWUzOTktNDAzMi1hNmYyLWQzMjg1MjhjYjA2OQBGAAAAAAApXOAAHQAETpD51vZ3… 1/5

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

RE: (W/S) / FW: SNM21D204582/C02/GBL3305P/LEWLC / FW: Direct Settlement -
Accident Involving GBL3305P (OI : CTI - TBA) AND SMN9159P (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/CTI21008714/Kba3) on 17/08/2021

Jenny Lew <jenny.lew@sg.cntaiping.com>
Fri 12/3/2021 11:02 AM
To:  Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>
Cc:  Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Hi Jaslin,
 
Please proceed:
 

1. Cost of Repair
$ 1,739.23 ($1,625.45 + 7% GST)

2. Loss of Rental (3 days x $104.00)  $ 312.00 (3 days x $104.00) 

3. LTA / GIA Search Fee $ 2.00

Surveyor recommended 2 days for repair +1PRS =3 DAYS

Thank you.
 
** Note: Please cc to claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com when you reply to us.
 
NOTICE :
In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delay is to
be expected for handling hardcopy documents. All correspondence should be made via email
claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com or fax at 6224 7175. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.
 
Regards,
 
Jenny Lew
Executive
Claims Department
 
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909 
DID: (65) 6389 6172 | Tel: (65) 6389 6116 |   F: (65) 6224 7175
  
W: www.sg.cntaiping.com   |    FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/   |   WeChat: 太平狮城 Taiping SG
 
Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any

unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient,

please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

 
From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Thursday, 25 November 2021 2:47 pm

To: Jenny Lew <jenny.lew@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: SNM21D204582/C02/GBL3305P/LEWLC / FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBL3305P (OI :
CTI - TBA) AND SMN9159P (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI21008714/Kba3) on 17/08/2021
 

mailto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
mailto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
http://www.sg.cntaiping.com/
http://www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/
mailto:jaslinkok@lkkauto.com
mailto:jenny.lew@sg.cntaiping.com
mailto:admin-a@lkkauto.com
mailto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
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Dear Sirs/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBL 3305P (CTI) AND SMN 9159P (TP) ON 17/08/2021

We refer to the above matter.

We seek your approval to offer repairer “CITY AUTO PTE LTD" at $ 2,053.23 (all-in).
 
The summary is as follows: -


Amount Claimed Amount Revised

1. Cost of Repair $ 2,683.03 $ 1,739.23 ($1,625.45 + 7% GST)

2. Loss of Rental (3 days x $104.00)  $ 312.00 $ 312.00 (3 days x $104.00) 

3. LTA / GIA Search Fee $ 2.00 $ 2.00

Surveyor recommended 2 days for repair +1PRS =3 DAYS

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.

Kindly let us have your approval / instruction.

 
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

 
From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Friday, 22 October 2021 11:33 AM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: SNM21D204582/C02/GBL3305P/LEWLC / FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBL3305P (OI :
CTI - TBA) AND SMN9159P (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI21008714/Kba3) on 17/08/2021
 
 
 
 
 

Best Regards,

Jasper Chua| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

 
From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Friday, 20 August 2021 5:38 PM


mailto:JaslinKok@lkkauto.com
mailto:jasperchua@lkkauto.com
mailto:jaslinkok@lkkauto.com
mailto:jasperchua@lkkauto.com
mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com
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To: Jenny Lew <jenny.lew@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com>; Admin
A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SNM21D204582/C02/GBL3305P/LEWLC / FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBL3305P (OI :
CTI - TBA) AND SMN9159P (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI21008714/Kba3) on 17/08/2021
 
Dear Jenny,
 
We refer to the above matter.
 
Enclosed for your perusal is:

-                 TP estimated cost of repair

-                 Preliminary advice

-                 Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition
 
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.
 
From: Jenny Lew [mailto:jenny.lew@sg.cntaiping.com] 

Sent: Friday, August 20, 2021 12:28 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>; Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com>; Admin A
<admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: SNM21D204582/C02/GBL3305P/LEWLC / FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBL3305P (OI :
CTI - TBA) AND SMN9159P (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI21008714/Kba3) on 17/08/2021
 
[Strictly Confidential]
 
Dear Mei Kwan,
 
Please refer to attached.
Thank you.
 
** Note: Please cc to claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com when you reply to us.
 
NOTICE :
In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delay is to
be expected for handling hardcopy documents. All correspondence should be made via email
claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com or fax at 6224 7175. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.
 
Regards,
 
Jenny Lew
Executive
Claims Department
 
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909 

mailto:jenny.lew@sg.cntaiping.com
mailto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
mailto:jasperchua@lkkauto.com
mailto:admin-a@lkkauto.com
mailto:MeiKwan@lkkauto.com
mailto:jenny.lew@sg.cntaiping.com
mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com
mailto:jasperchua@lkkauto.com
mailto:admin-a@lkkauto.com
mailto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
mailto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
mailto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
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DID: (65) 6389 6172 | Tel: (65) 6389 6116 |   F: (65) 6225 5879
  
W: www.sg.cntaiping.com   |    FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/   |   WeChat: 太平狮城 Taiping SG
 
Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any

unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient,

please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

 
From: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com> 

Sent: Friday, August 20, 2021 11:17 AM

To: Meikwan@lkkauto.com; jasperchua@lkkauto.com; admin-a@lkkauto.com; Jenny Lew
<jenny.lew@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: O/R: SNM21D204582/C02/GBL3305P/LEWLC / FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBL3305P (OI :
CTI - TBA) AND SMN9159P (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI21008714/Kba3) on 17/08/2021
 
Dear all,
 
Please note that officer in charge for this case is Jenny Lew.
 
Claim no SNM21D204582/C02/GBL3305P/LEWLC.
 
Dear Jenny,
 
Pls revert LKK.
 
 
NOTICE :
In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us
as delay is to be expected for handling hardcopy documents.  All correspondence should be made
via email claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com or fax at 6224 7175. Any inconvenience caused is much
regretted.
 
Thank you
 
Chong Boon Sen
Claims Department
 
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909 
DID: (65) 63896116   |   F: (65) 62247175  
  
W: www.sg.cntaiping.com   |    FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/   |   WeChat: 太平狮
城 Taiping SG
 
Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any

unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient,

please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

 
 
 
 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Thursday, 19 August 2021 3:42 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>
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CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Cc: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBL3305P (OI : CTI - TBA) AND SMN9159P (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/CTI21008714/Kba3) on 17/08/2021
 

 

Dear Sir / Madam,
 
We refer to the above matter.
 
We have received an assignment from TP repairer, M/s City Auto Pte Ltd - Sin Ming and TP repairer proposed
for a direct settlement.
 
Enclosed for your perusal is:

TP GIA report
Estimated cost of repair

 
Kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report and claim ref for our necessary action.
 
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Jasper.
 
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.
 
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.
 

mailto:jasperchua@lkkauto.com
mailto:admin-a@lkkauto.com
mailto:MeiKwan@lkkauto.com
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