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Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMN 9159P AND GBL 3305P ON THE 17/08/2021

Collection Wee's <weescollection@gmail.com>
Thu 10/21/2021 4:32 PM
To:  Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>
Cc:  Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Hi Jaslin,

Noted with thanks and have a good weekend ahead.

Regards,
David

Get Outlook for Android

From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, October 21, 2021 4:19:32 PM

To: weescollection@gmail.com <weescollection@gmail.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMN 9159P AND GBL 3305P ON THE 17/08/2021
 
Dear David

We noted your concern regarding the repair cost.

As reported, it is a head-to-rear collision. Vehicles are designed to absorb impact energy rather than to resist
energy within the impact force limits. Compared to the rear portion, the front portion of a vehicle is usually
stronger and tougher as the front portion houses most of the mechanical & electrical components like engine.
 
Our surveyor had physically conducted survey to third party vehicle and is in the view that the damages
sustained to the Third-Party vehicle is consistent to the nature of accident as reported. The adjusted repair
cost to third party vehicle is at $1,625.45(before GST).
 
The repair cost includes replacement of Rear bumper, Rear Tailgate, Rear logo, bumper sponge, Reverse
sensor and Labour charges to re-spray, remove, repair and renews affected areas etc.
 
We attached here with the damage photos during our inspection for your easy reference.
 
Please be informed that the amount is not yet finalized.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

 
From: Collection Wee's <weescollection@gmail.com> 

Sent: Wednesday, 1 September 2021 11:00 AM


https://aka.ms/AAb9ysg
mailto:JaslinKok@lkkauto.com
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To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMN 9159P AND GBL 3305P ON THE 17/08/2021
 
Hi Jasper,
 
Noted, may we check on the damage cost?
 
Regards,
David
 
Get Outlook for Android

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, September 1, 2021 10:44:54 AM

To: WEESCOLLECTION@GMAIL.COM <WEESCOLLECTION@GMAIL.COM>

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMN 9159P AND GBL 3305P ON THE 17/08/2021
 
Our Ref: CC6/CTI21008714/Kba3
 
01 SEPTEMBER 2021                                                                                                             
 
WEE'S COLLECTION
Driver : DAVID WEE SOON JIN
 
Dear Sir/Madam,
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMN 9159P AND GBL 3305P ON THE 17/08/2021
 
We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve
the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.
 
We have received a claim from Body Repairer/Workshop acting on behalf of the owner of SMN 9159P against
your motor insurance policy.
               
Based on the accident report, accident scenario and evidence at hand, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.
 
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please
contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.
 
Please call us if you have further queries.
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. 
Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much
regretted.
 

Best Regards,

Jasper Chua| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.
 

 

https://aka.ms/AAb9ysg
mailto:jasperchua@lkkauto.com
mailto:WEESCOLLECTION@GMAIL.COM
mailto:WEESCOLLECTION@GMAIL.COM
mailto:jasperchua@lkkauto.com

