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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Sent: Thursday, 19 August 2021 3:21 PM
To: Boon Wah Sin
Subject: RE: Accident Involving SLS 5581P and SDS 1133X on 17/05/2021 along/at 1 Seletar Rd, 

Carpark
Attachments: TP PIR.pdf

Dear Sir,  
 
We have previously rejected Third Party claim. 
 
However, case has currently be re-open. Third Party has provide us with traffic police investigation result slip (as 
attached for your easy reference).  
 
You are being charged for careless driving.  
 
In view of above, we will proceed to settle with Third Party at best.  
 
Thanks  
 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim 
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
 
Best Regards, 
Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, 
#02-25 | S(408933) Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 
 
-----Original Message----- 
From: Boon Wah Sin <sinboonwah@gmail.com> 
Sent: Thursday, 17 June 2021 2:58 PM 
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Accident Involving SLS 5581P and SDS 1133X on 17/05/2021 along/at 1 Seletar Rd, Carpark 
 
Your  Ref CC4/AIG21006495/gs3 dated 14 Jun 2021 
 
Dear Cecilia, 
 
I refer to our conversation this afternoon. 
 
I have told you previously that I had filed the report with AIG reporting center at Sin Ming Service Center.  I am waiting 
for a copy to be extended to me.  When I receive  it,  I would extend it to you.  
 
 
Thanks.   


