Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 31 August 2021 2:22 PM

To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: #%%: GBK7080R SURVEYED ON 18/08/2021

R4 A: paulinekoh@abengineering.sg <paulinekoh@abengineering.sg>

. &Ri%: 2021 4£ 8 A 31 H 14:21:58 (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore
ek A : Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@Ilkkauto.com>

F&i: RE: GBK7080R SURVEYED ON 18/08/2021

Dear Guo Qiang

We are agreeable the COR at $2200.

Warmest Regards,

Pauline Koh

AB Engineering Pte Ltd

25 Senang Crescent Singapore 416598

TEL: +65 6749 9699 (Office) | +65 6747 7791 (Fax)

From: paulinekoh@abengineering.sg <paulinekoh@abengineering.sg>
Sent: Monday, 30 August 2021 4:37 pm

To: 'Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)' <GuoQiang@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: GBK7080R SURVEYED ON 18/08/2021

Dear Guo Qiang

Thanks.

Warmest Regards,

Pauline Koh

AB Engineering Pte Ltd

25 Senang Crescent Singapore 416598

TEL: +65 6749 9699 (Office) | +65 6747 7791 (Fax)

From: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, 30 August 2021 1:07 pm




To: paulinekoh@abengineering.sg
Subject: @E: GBK7080R SURVEYED ON 18/08/2021

Dear Pauline,

Finalize COR $2200 before GST @ 3 days.
COR subject to insurance approval.

Regards,
Guo Qiang

B paulinekoh@abengineering.sg <paulinekoh@abengineering.sg>
RIEHTE]): 2021 4 8 H 30 H 12:44

etk A : Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com>

= : RE: GBK7080R SURVEYED ON 18/08/2021

Dear Guo Qiang
Thanks for your reply.

Please refer to the above photos. As end panel dented so We would like to ask for additional labour costs $150, and
painting $150.

Kindly consider.
Thanks
Warmest Regards,

Pauline Koh

AB Engineering Pte Ltd

25 Senang Crescent Singapore 416598

TEL: +65 6749 9699 (Office) | +65 6747 7791 (Fax)

From: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@Ilkkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, 30 August 2021 12:27 pm

To: paulinekoh@abengineering.sg

Subject: [1] & : GBK7080R SURVEYED ON 18/08/2021

Dear Pauline,

Finalize COR $2000 before GST @ 3 days.
COR subject to insurance approval.

Regards,
Guo Qiang



B paulinekoh@abengineering.sg <paulinekoh@abengineering.sg>
RIEHTE]: 2021 4 8 H 30 H 11:57

etk A : Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com>

E: FW: GBK7080R SURVEYED ON 18/08/2021

Dear Guo Qiang
Please let us hear from you soonest possible.

Thanks.

Warmest Regards,

Pauline Koh

AB Engineering Pte Ltd

25 Senang Crescent Singapore 416598

TEL: +65 6749 9699 (Office) | +65 6747 7791 (Fax)

From: paulinekoh@abengineering.sg <paulinekoh@abengineering.sg>
Sent: Monday, 23 August 2021 2:55 pm

To: 'guogiang@lkkauto.com' <guogiang@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: FW: GBK7080R SURVEYED ON 18/08/2021

Dear Guo Qiang

Please let us hear from you as soon as possible.

Warmest Regards,

Pauline Koh

AB Engineering Pte Ltd

25 Senang Crescent Singapore 416598

TEL: +65 6749 9699 (Office) | +65 6747 7791 (Fax)

From: paulinekoh@abengineering.sg <paulinekoh@abengineering.sg>
Sent: Friday, 20 August 2021 10:55 am

To: 'guogiang@lkkauto.com' <guogiang@lkkauto.com>

Subject: GBK7080R SURVEYED ON 18/08/2021

Dear Guo Qiang

We attached hereby the photos of GBK7080R which showed the end panel badly dented



Therefore, we would like to claims the labour for panel beat at $150 and putty /spray painting at $150. For repair day,
we need 4 days to complete.

Kindly consider.
Thanks.

Warmest Regards,
Pauline Koh

AB Engineering Pte Ltd

25 Senang Crescent Singapore 416598
TEL: +65 6749 9699 (Office) | +65 6747 7791 (Fax)



