Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 13 October 2021 11:29 am
To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: FW: SMM 9776M FINALISE

From: Thanaletchumi Santerashigaram <thana@jackcars.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 13 October 2021 11:29:05 am (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: SMM 9776M FINALISE

Greetings Mr.Taufikh ,

For an amicable settlement would agree with the COR @ $4420.22 B4 GST with DOR @ 5.
Kindly advise on the submission of the LOD.

Kindly reply.

Thank You.

Best Regards ,

S.Thanaletchumi (Ms)

Claims Manager

JACK CARS ENTERPRISE PTE LTD
Office : 67488824

Mobile : 91701900

Fax :67488834

Email : thana@jackcars.com.sq

Save the Earth- Print only when necessary-

On Fri, Oct 8, 2021 at 4:44 PM Taufikh (LKK Auto) <taufikh@I|kkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Thana,

Please refer attached, COR P/P $4420.22 , 5 DAYS.

Regards

Taufikh

Lkk Auto



