9/30/21, 9:15 AM Mail - Denise Tay (LKKAuto) - Outlook

Re: RE : FINALISATION FOR SLM5962E

Claims Dept <claims_ltm@bifrostauto.com>
Tue 28/9/2021 5:01 PM
To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Claims Dept <claims_ltr@bifrostauto.com>; Claims Dept <claims_ltv@bifrostauto.com>; Joseph Koh
<joseph.koh@bifrostauto.com>

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Hi Denise,
Confirmed.

LC LIM

Thanks & Regards,

Bifrost Auto Pte Ltd
Accident Claims Dept

On Tue, 28 Sept 2021 at 14:22, Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@Ilkkauto.com> wrote:
Dear Sir,

Please confirm the same of lump sum $2900, 4days

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Claims Dept <claims_Itm@bifrostauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 24 September 2021 4:26 pm

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Accident Claims Dept <claims_ltr@bifrostauto.com>; Claims Dept <claims_ltv@bifrostauto.com>; Joseph
Koh <joseph.koh@bifrostauto.com>

Subject: RE : FINALISATION FOR SLM5962E

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Hi Kenneth,
Pls confirm the finalisation as follows. Photos enclosed.

PARTS SUPPLEMENTARY ALL LABOUR
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$858.00
$30.00
$32.00
$698.00
$588.00
$102.00

$2,308.00
Less 10% $230.80

$2,077.20

Less 20%

LS

Pls revert asap.

LC LIM

Thanks & Regards,
Bifrost Auto Pte Ltd
Accident Claims Dept
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$773.00
Less 10% $77.30

$695.70

$3,682.90
$736.58
$2,946.32

$2,900.00

$910.00
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