10/12/21, 12:03 PM Mail - Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) - Outlook

Re: Your Ref: SKW9459A // DOA: 11/08/2021// LKK REF:
CC4/11121008585/Apa3(SHD2147G)

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Tue 12/10/2021 12:03 PM

To: Kai Motor <kaimotor@gmail.com>

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
Thank you for your acceptance.

Please duly sign the documents enclosed and return together with your client's authorisation to act to us (LKK) for
our necessary action.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred

from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues

of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Kai Motor <kaimotor@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 11 October 2021 12:39 pm

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Your Ref: SKW9459A // DOA: 11/08/2021// LKK REF: CC4/11121008585/Apa3(SHD2147G)
Hi Hsiao Tong,

We accept your offer.
Settlement at $2,286.95(all-in)

Kindly forward payment to us asap.

Have a nice day with thanks.

RIZHEIFRI—XK.

Ms Kim

On Fri, 8 Oct 2021 at 14:40, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ilkkauto.com> wrote:
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Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement at $2,286.95(all-in).
Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /

inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the

issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 5 October 2021 2:25 pm

To: Kai Motor <kaimotor@gmail.com>

Subject: Re: Your Ref: SKW9459A // DOA: 11/08/2021// LKK REF: CC4/11121008585/Apa3(SHD2147G)

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We acknowledge receipt of your email dated 05/10/2021.

We will look into the matter and get back to you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /

inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the

issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Kai Motor <kaimotor@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 5 October 2021 1:55 pm
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To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: Your Ref: SKW9459A // DOA: 11/08/2021// LKK REF: CC4/11121008585/Apa3(SHD2147G)

Date : 21/09/2021

Attn: The Motor Claims Department
Your Insured Vehicle -SHD2147G

India International Insurance Pte Ltd
64 Cecil Street

#04/#05 10B Building DID: 6347 6072 Mike
Singapore 049711 Charlotte 6378382

Tel : 6347 6110 6347 6071 Sundari Nagarajan
Fax : 6224 4174 6347 6072 Thema Choo

F:6225 7743 ***
Final Cost of Repair Bill for VEHICLE No. SKW 9459 A & SHD 2147 G on 11/08/2021 @ 10:15.

To Supply :-

Total Lumpsum As Of Repair Costs Recommended By Surveyor And

Agreed By Ourselves : S 1,850.00
GST 7%.S 129.50
S 1,979.50

Date : 16/08/2021

Attn: The Motor Claims Department
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Your Insured Vehicle -SHD2147G

India International Insurance Pte Ltd
64 Cecil Street

#04/#05 10B Building DID: 6347 6072 Mike
Singapore 049711 Charlotte 6378382

Tel : 6347 6110 6347 6071 Sundari Nagarajan
Fax : 6224 4174 6347 6072 Thema Choo

F: 62257743 ***

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE No. SKW 9459 A & SHD 2147 G on 11/08/2021 @ 10:15.

We have been authorised by LEE KOK HIANG , the owner of vehicle
claim against the party/ parties responsible for the damages arising from number SKW 9459 A,
to the above mentioned accident.

Our records show that you are the insurers of vehicle number (SHD 2147 G) at the material time
of the accident with the driver of our client’s vehicle, ( LEE KOK HIANG ).

As a result of the accident caused by your insured driver’s negligent driving and/or management
of your insured’s vehicle number (SHD 2147 G), our client’s vehicle was damaged and we have
been put to loss and damage as follows:

(1) Cost of repair S 1,979.50
(2) Loss of use 3 Days X $120 S 360.00
(3) PIR 2days S 200.00
(4) LTA Search Fee S 7.45

S 2,546.95

A cope of each of the following supporting documents is enclosed:

(a) Final repair bill
(b) GIA report with sketch plan of (our client’s veh number)
(c) LTA Search

On Fri, 1 Oct 2021 at 14:02, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ilkkauto.com> wrote:
Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.
For COR, recommended amount at L/sum $1,850.00(before GST) with 03 repair days.

Kindly forward your LOD with all the relevant documents(ie: final repair bill, authorisation to act, rental receipt)
to us (LKK) for our necessary action.

Please note that all the finalisation subject to insurer approval.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be

deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.
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In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the

issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Have a nice day with thanks.

RIEERFI—XK.

Ms Kim
Kai Motor Trading

Blk 3007 Ubi Rd 1 #01-440
Singapore 408701
Telephone: 6747 4006

Have a nice day with thanks.

RIEBEREFI—XK.

Ms Kim
Kai Motor Trading

Blk 3007 Ubi Rd 1 #01-440

Singapore 408701
Telephone: 6747 4006

https://outlook.office.com/mail/sentitems/id/AAMKAGUOZDViNzgxLWESMTItNDkxMi1hZWIXLTA3MjhIMTAON2RiINgBGAAAAAADI7f6WE2MfQpF%...  5/5


mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com

