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Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); CS A Team; Admin A; mschong@millionauto.com
Cc: Admin-D (LKKAuto); wendy@millionauto.com
Subject: RE: ref: GBG8160H third party claim LOD

 

From: Ms Chong [mailto:mschong@millionauto.com]  
Sent: Tuesday, 7 September 2021 5:15 PM 
To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: 'Wendy Ang' <wendy@millionauto.com> 
Subject: ref: GBG8160H third party claim LOD 
 
Dear Jafter, 
Please refer to the attachments for GBG8160H third party claim documents. 
We look forward on your favorable reply. 
Thanks ! 
 
Lump sum repair cost $3,370.50 
Loss of rental 5 days $680 
LTA search $7.45 
Total: $4,057.95 
 
 
 
 
Best Regards,  
Ms Chong 
Million Auto Service 
No.4 Penjuru Place #01-12,  
Singapore 608782 
62649091/82285020 
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Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)
Sent: September 7, 2021 8:35 PM
To: fanny_loi@tanchong.com
Cc: HONEYSIM1234@GMAIL.COM
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBG 8160H AND GBK 4160M ON THE 28/06/2021

Our Ref: CC4/AIG21008569/Ebs3 
 
METAQUIP TC INDUSTRIAL PTE LTD ( BY EMAIL ONLY ) 
Driver : SIM WEI HAO 
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBG 8160H AND GBK 4160M ON THE 28/06/2021 
 
We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against you 
and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them. 
                 
Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to negotiate 
for an amicable settlement with the Third Party. 
 
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us 
within 10 days from the date of this letter. 
 
Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for commercial vehicles) 
upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed 
utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.  
 
Please call us if you have further queries. 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission 
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 

Best Regards, 

Jasper Chua| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 
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This mail is associated with :



*GBG8160H (5230417240SG)

[GBK4160M]


TP

E-FULFILLMENT PTE LTD


Jun 28 2021 3:00PM

[METAQUIP TC INDUSTRIAL PTE LTD]


Million Auto Service



 



From   AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) (AIG_SG_EXPRESS), sent on 24/09/2021 03:33 AM.
To   LKK_HQ
Subject   Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$3912.95) - GBG8160H - Claim Handler: Tan, Bennie-WZ


Approved:3912.95:SUBJ TO ALL DOCS/BILLINGS IN ORDER, SAB FROM: $3805.95-3912.95 (ALL-IN).

 
DOCUMENTS SUMMARY
 There are no documents.
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