Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 26 September 2022 5:14 PM
To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: %% Finalise of SJJ) 9957)

R4 A: Admin AP Automotive Services <mota@apautomotive.services>

S Ri%: 2022 £ 9 A 26 H 17:13:10 (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore

e A : Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@Ilkkauto.com>; Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@Ikkauto.com>
$i%: Juliana . <juliana@apautomotive.services>; Paul Ho <paul@apautomotive.services>; Marcus Teo
<marcus@apautosg.com>; Chrystia Liew <chrystia@apautomotive.services>; info <info@apautosg.com>; Nic Chia
<nic@apautomotive.services>; ClickUp: S]] 9957] <a.c.1teft7e.u-37601221.fd4444b5-abc7-4dde-992f-
7e603ccb44d7@tasks.clickup.com>; Motor Survey <motorsurvey@sg.msig-asia.com>

E 8 Re: Finalise of S1] 9957]

Dear Guo Qiang,

As spoken to you, we accepted the COR offer of $14,900.00 and 12 repair days.
We will submit the LOD accordingly.

Best regards,

Zaleha
AP Automotive Services Pte Ltd

ROC: 202022890H

56 Loyang Way

#04-04 Loyang Enterprise Building
SINGAPORE 508775

TEL: 6970 4786 FAX: 69704790

On Sat, 30 Jul 2022 at 09:25, Admin AP Automotive Services
<{mota@apautomotive. services> wrote:

Dear Guo Qiang

Refer to the above email dated 13.05.2021.

May we have the finalised amount ASAP as we need to submit LOD.
Looking forward to hear from you soon

Please do not hesitate to contact me should you have any queries thereof.
Thank you

Best regards,



Zaleha

AP Automotive Services Pte Ltd
ROC: 202022890H

BLK 9006 TAMPINES ST 93

#01-202 TAMPINES INDUSTRIAL PARK A
SINGAPORE 528840

TEL: 6970 4786 FAX: 6787 4886

On Wed, 22 Jun 2022 at 16:49, Admin AP Automotive Services
<{mota@apautomotive. services> wrote:
Dear Guo Qiang,

Kindly let us have your finalisation.

Best regards,

Zaleha

AP Automotive Services Pte Ltd
ROC: 202022890H

BLK 9006 TAMPINES ST 93

#01-202 TAMPINES INDUSTRIAL PARK A
SINGAPORE 528840

TEL: 6970 4786 FAX: 6787 4886

On Fri, 13 May 2022 at 13:16, Admin AP Automotive Services
<{mota@apautomotive. services> wrote:
Dear Guo Qiang

Attached after repair photos as requested.

Kindly let us have your finalise.

Best regards,

Zaleha

AP Automotive Services Pte Ltd
ROC: 202022890H

BLK 9006 TAMPINES ST 93

#01-202 TAMPINES INDUSTRIAL PARK A
SINGAPORE 528840

TEL: 6970 4786 FAX: 6787 4886

On Mon, 7 Mar 2022 at 12:24, Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com> wrote:




Hi Zaleha,
Please manage to get SJJ 9957] after repair photos as insurance requested, thanks.
Regards,

Guo Qiang

From: Admin AP Automotive Services [mailto:mota@apautomotive.services]
Sent: Monday, 7 March, 2022 12:17 PM

To: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: Finalise of SJ) 9957

Hi Guo Qiang

We did not take the after paint photos.

Best regards,

Zaleha

AP Automotive Services Pte Ltd
ROC: 202022890H

BLK 9006 TAMPINES ST 93

#01-202 TAMPINES INDUSTRIAL PARK A
SINGAPORE 528840

TEL: 6970 4786 FAX: 6787 4886

On Mon, 7 Mar 2022 at 11:55, Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com> wrote:




Hi Zaleha,
Please provide SJJ 9957] after repair photos, thanks.
Regards,

Guo Qiang

From: Admin AP Automotive Services [mailto:mota@apautomotive.services]
Sent: Tuesday, 22 February, 2022 4:05 PM

To: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: Finalise of SJ) 9957

Hi Guo Qiang,

Attached estimate marking as requested.

Best regards,

Zaleha

AP Automotive Services Pte Ltd
ROC: 202022890H

BLK 9006 TAMPINES ST 93

#01-202 TAMPINES INDUSTRIAL PARK A
SINGAPORE 528840

TEL: 6970 4786 FAX: 6787 4886

On Tue, 22 Feb 2022 at 15:14, Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com> wrote:




Dear Zaleha,

Please provide SJJ 9957] estimate marking, thanks.

Regards,

Guo Qiang



