Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 1 September 2021 10:52 am
To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: B4 AFTER REPAIR PHOTOS OF GY8406X

R4 A: paulinekoh@abengineering.sg <paulinekoh@abengineering.sg>
C&#%: 2021 4£9 A 1 H 10:51:50 (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore
ek A : Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com>

FE@i: RE: AFTER REPAIR PHOTOS OF GY8406X

Dear Guo Qiang
We are agreeable to the lump sum repair costs at $1700.

Thanks.

Warmest Regards,

Pauline Koh

AB Engineering Pte Ltd

25 Senang Crescent Singapore 416598

TEL: +65 6749 9699 (Office) | +65 6747 7791 (Fax)

From: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@Ilkkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 1 September 2021 9:53 am

To: paulinekoh@abengineering.sg

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>
Subject: #% /<: AFTER REPAIR PHOTOS OF GY8406X

Dear Pauline,

Finalize COR $1700 before GST @ 3 days.
COR subject to insurance approval.

Regards,
Guo Qiang

RN : Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com>

RIERTE]: 2021 4F 8 A 30 H 12:53

ek A : paulinekoh@abengineering.sg <paulinekoh@abengineering.sg>
X J8i: 115 : AFTER REPAIR PHOTOS OF GY8406X

Dear Pauline,



Finalize COR $1700 before GST @ 3 days.
COR subject to insurance approval.

Regards,
Guo Qiang

B paulinekoh@abengineering.sg <paulinekoh@abengineering.sg>
RILHTE]: 2021 4 8 H 26 H 09:18

etk A : Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com>

ZE: FW: AFTER REPAIR PHOTOS OF GY8406X

Dear Guo Qiang

We refer to the above subject.
Kindly finalize asap.

Thank you in advance.
Warmest Regards,

Pauline Koh

AB Engineering Pte Ltd

25 Senang Crescent Singapore 416598
TEL: +65 6749 9699 (Office) | +65 6747 7791 (Fax)

From: paulinekoh@abengineering.sg <paulinekoh@abengineering.sg>
Sent: Friday, 20 August 2021 11:42 am

To: 'guogiang@lkkauto.com' <guogiang@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: FW: AFTER REPAIR PHOTOS OF GY8406X

Dear Guo Qiang

Kindly finalize asap.

Warmest Regards,

Pauline Koh

AB Engineering Pte Ltd

25 Senang Crescent Singapore 416598

TEL: +65 6749 9699 (Office) | +65 6747 7791 (Fax)

From: paulinekoh@abengineering.sg <paulinekoh@abengineering.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 19 August 2021 3:04 pm

To: 'guogiang@lkkauto.com' <guogiang@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: FW: AFTER REPAIR PHOTOS OF GY8406X




Dear Guo Qiang

Kindly finalize asap. Thanks.

Warmest Regards,

Pauline Koh

AB Engineering Pte Ltd

25 Senang Crescent Singapore 416598

TEL: +65 6749 9699 (Office) | +65 6747 7791 (Fax)

From: paulinekoh@abengineering.sg <paulinekoh@abengineering.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 17 August 2021 1:08 pm

To: 'guogiang@lkkauto.com' <guogiang@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: AFTER REPAIR PHOTOS OF GY8406X

Dear Guo Qiang
Please refer to the above subject and attachments.

Kindly finalize asap. Thanks.

Warmest Regards,

Pauline Koh

AB Engineering Pte Ltd

25 Senang Crescent Singapore 416598

TEL: +65 6749 9699 (Office) | +65 6747 7791 (Fax)

From: paulinekoh@abengineering.sg <paulinekoh@abengineering.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 17 August 2021 1:03 pm

To: 'guogiang@lkkauto.com' <guogiang@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: AFTER REPAIR PHOTOS OF GY8406X

Dear Guo Qiang

Please refer to the above subject and attachments.

Warmest Regards,

Pauline Koh

AB Engineering Pte Ltd

25 Senang Crescent Singapore 416598

TEL: +65 6749 9699 (Office) | +65 6747 7791 (Fax)



