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Hui Zhen (LKK Auto)

From: puanchew@singnet.com.sg

Sent: Monday, 23 August 2021 2:03 pm

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Cc: Hui Zhen (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: AFTER PAINT PHOTOS - SCF 954 E

Hi Mr. Rasul, 

  

We accept the finalised lump sum repair amount of $2,500 and 6 days of repair. 

  

Thank you. 

  

Regards 

Rose 
  
From: Rasul (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Friday, August 20, 2021 2:41 PM 
To: puanchew@singnet.com.sg  

Cc: Hui Zhen (LKK Auto)  
Subject: RE: AFTER PAINT PHOTOS - SCF 954 E 

  
Hi Ms Rose, 

  
Refer to attachment 

Audit check parts prices slightly high. need verification. 

Finalised amount is $ 2500 / 6 days of lump sum repair 

Kindly confirm the amount and revert back 

  
  
  

  

Best Regards, 

Rasul | Assessor 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

  

From: puanchew@singnet.com.sg [mailto:puanchew@singnet.com.sg]  

Sent: Thursday, 19 August, 2021 2:30 PM 
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) 

Subject: Re: AFTER PAINT PHOTOS - SCF 954 E 

  
Dear Mr. Rasul, 
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I would appreciate if you can let me have the finalize amount soonest so as to enable me to close this matter. 

  

Thank you for your kind assistance towards this matter. 

  

Regards 

Rose 

  
  
From: puanchew@singnet.com.sg  

Sent: Tuesday, August 17, 2021 5:14 PM 
To: rasul@lkkauto.com  

Subject: AFTER PAINT PHOTOS - SCF 954 E 

  

Dear Mr. Rasul, 

  

As spoken to you, I attached the after paint photos of our client’s vehicle SCF 954 E. 

  

Thank you. 

  

Regards 

Rose 
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