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India International Insurance Pte Ltd
64 Cecil Street

#04-02 10B Building

Singapore 049711

By Email Only

Tan Bee Teck

Block 117 Ang Mo Kio Avenue 4

#05-447 By Certificate of Posting
Singapore 560117

Grab Rentals Pte Ltd

6 Battery Road

#38-04 By Certificate of Posting
Singapore 049909

Dear Sirs,

NEWCON BUILDERS PTE LTD

C/o 133 New Bridge Road, #17-03 Chinatown Point, Singapore 059413

ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP 4083D AND SLP 4383S ALONG JUNCTION OF
PIONEER ROAD NORTH AND NANYANG FLYOVER ON 13.07.2021

We refer to the above matter.

We are instructed by the above named to claim damages against you / your authorised
driver / your insured in connection with a road traffic accident on 13 July 2021 along
junction of Pioneer Road North and Nanyang Flyover, involving our client’s motor
vehicle bearing registration number YP 4083D and the motor vehicle bearing
registration number SLP 4383S, which was driven / owned / insured by you at the
material time.

We are instructed that the accident was caused by your / your authorised driver’s /
your insured’s negligent driving and/or management of the motor vehicle SLP 4383S.
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The information contained in this letter / facsimile message is CONFIDENTIAL and may also be LEGALLY PRIVILEGED, intended only for the individual or entity named above.
If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any use, revelation, dissemination, distribution or copying of this document is strictly prohibited. If you have
received this document in error, please notify us immediately by telephone (call the number above) and destroy the original message.
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As a result of the accident, our client’s vehicle was damaged and our client has been
put to loss and expenses, particulars of which are as follows:

(1) Cost of repairs - $ 5,671.00
(2) Loss ofuse - $ 1,620.00
(3) Survey Fee - $ 701.00
(4) LTA search fee - $ 10.00
(5) GIA search and report fee - $ 29.00
(6) Incidentals - $ 100.00
(7) Costs - $ 900.00
(8) GST on items (6) & (7) - $ 70.00
$ 9,101.00
A copy each of the supporting documents are enclosed.
S/NO. | AVAILABLE DOCS | PARTICULARS
Client’s Documents
1. 14.07.2021 GIA Statement ~Fraffie Policereport
2. Witness{es)-Staterent
3. Arectdentsitephotostaphs
4. Video footage / CCTV / CD recording
5. 06.08.2021 Repair bill Hnvetee/Exeess Faxinvoiee
6. Rental bl / invoice and agreement 7 receipt
7. VehieleEntryPermitreceipt E-daylicenseforoff-peak
vehiele
8. Towing fees / receipt (Singapore / Malaysia)
0. Chentbsold-ofveliclemd produce tetter rom-EFA
10. Spare Part Ordering Form
11. 06.08.2021 Survey invoice and surveyor’s report
12. 06.08.2021 76 Original/ Copies of damage photographs
13. Enquire PARE/COE Rebatefor RegisteredVehiele
14. CertHiente—of-hsurmee——MeotorCover-Note—New—Pohey
Sechedule/Registration-Card/- Grant/ Reoad Fax
15. 19.07.2021 Pre-repair Inspection Notices
16. Fraffic Policetnvesticationresults
17. Estittted-agrecment-bebwechstrvevor hdreparer
18. 15.07.2021 Tax invoices and search results from General Insurance
Association of Singapore (GIA) andTFratfiePolice——search
fees
Third Party’s Documents
19. 14.07.2021 GIA Statement ~Fraffic Policerepeort
20. AdmisstonNote
21. 16.07.2021 LTA search freeeiptHaxinveoiee
22. Malaysta-Vehieles Searches+serviee
23. REBAACRA-secarch
24, Enhanced Individual scarch / reccipt
Others (Apply only in chain collisions and/or any other documents)
25.
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We have on 19 July 2021 notified you / your insurer of the accident and a pre-repair
inspection of our client’s motor vehicle was carried out by the appointed surveyors.

Subject to our client’s instructions, please confirm in writing within 7 days hereof if you
/ your insured wish to inspect our client’s vehicle.

Please note that you / your insurer should send to us an acknowledgement of
receipt of this letter within 14 days of your receipt of this letter, failing which our
client will have no alternative but to commence proceedings against you without
further notice to you / your insurer. In this event, you / your insurer will be liable
for any and all legal costs incurred.

Please also note that if you have a counterclaim against our client arising out of the
accident, you are also required to send to us a letter giving full particulars of the
counterclaim together with all relevant supporting documents within 8 weeks of your
receipt of this letter, which we will then forward to our client and/or the insurers for
consideration on a without prejudice basis.

For avoidance of doubt, kindly note that this claim is made without prejudice to our
client’s personal injury claim.

In light of the COVID-19 outbreak, our staff members are working from home.
Please expect delays in our replies during this time. We apologize for any
inconvenience caused.

Yours faithfully,
KSCHP Juris LLP

(Chinatown Point Office)
Enc.
Cc client



