Hui Zhen (LKK Auto)

From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 1 October 2021 12:14 PM
To: Cindy HAN (SCDF)

Cc: June YAP (SCDF)

Subject: RE: SMV 91S

Hi Cindy

Noted on the contents of your email.
We will proceed to purchase the full report following the steps set out in your email below.

Best Regards,

Bryan Ang

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: bryanang@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Cindy HAN (SCDF) <Cindy HAN@scdf.gov.sg>
Sent: Friday, 1 October 2021 12:04 PM

To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>
Cec: June YAP (SCDF) <June YAP@scdf.gov.sg>
Subject: RE: SMV 918

Dear Mr. Ang,
| refer to our conversation on 1 Oct 2021.

2 SCDF investigations are into the Origin and Cause of fire, which in essence, refers to ‘where the fire started’
and ‘what was the ignition source’ respectively. We do not probe into liability nor apportioning of blame.

3 Kindly see below the steps for purchase of the detailed fire report.

a. The Fire Investigation Report (SCDF//20210724/0737) can be made available to you at a cost of Five
Hundred and Forty-Five Dollars (SGD 545.00), inclusive of GST.

b. It can be applied online through SCDF e-services website
(https://eservicesl.scdf.gov.sg/fisops/SCDF-ESERVICES.action?app=EPAYMENT), click “Next” and proceed
to select “6. Miscellaneous Payments”. The payment for the purchase can be made via GIRO, credit / debit card
or internet direct banking (e.g. eNETS). During the application, we seek your assistance to furnish the
following information:

Reference 20210724/0737/1
No.
Description of | Report to be mailed to:
payment Name:
Address:




c. For payments made via GIRO (applicants with existing GIRO account with SCDF), the GIRO
deduction will take 14 working days to be processed. The applicants may visit our website at
www.scdf.gov.sg/home/e-services/fire-ambulance-reports for more information.

d. The preparation of the requested report will commence after receipt of notification from our Finance
Department on the successful deduction of the fees.

4 You may contact us at 6848 3345/3349 for clarifications.

5 Thank you.

Best regards,

Cindy Han

Senior Fire Investigator

Fire Investigation Unit

Singapore Civil Defence Force

DID: (65) 6848 3345| FAX: (65) 6848 3368
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From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, 30 September 2021 11:32 am

To: June YAP (SCDF) <June YAP@scdf.gov.sg>
Subject: SMV 918

Hi June

We met the other day at your office together with AXA’s representatives to view the photos of the
above mentioned vehicle.

Regarding the full fire report, | went to SCDF website but could not find any link that leads to
purchasing the detailed report online.

For your advice please.

Best Regards,

Bryan Ang

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: bryanang@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




