Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 31 August 2022 5:15 PM
To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: SMK 2636R FINALISE

Hi Shiau Chan,

FYI, Workshop agree COR.

Regards
Taufikh

From: Tsl Auto [mailto:tslautogarage@gmail.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 31 August 2022 4:24 PM

To: Taufikh (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: SMK 2636R FINALISE

Ok we close at this amount

On Wed, 31 Aug 2022 at 4:23 PM, Taufikh (LKK Auto) <taufikh @lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi,

Our final offer is lumpsum $1500, 4 days.

Regards
Taufikh

Lkk Auto

From: Tsl Auto [mailto:tslautogarage@gmail.com]
Sent: Monday, 23 May 2022 9:58 PM

To: Taufikh (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: SMK 2636R FINALISE

Hi Taufikh

Can we close at $1900 lump sum



On Fri, 13 May 2022 at 12:23 PM, Taufikh (LKK Auto) <taufikh @lkkauto.com> wrote:

HI,

“Without Prejudice”

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of lumpsum $1500/- with 4 days of repair,
subject to their approval.

Regards
Taufikh

Lkk Auto

From: Tsl Auto [mailto:tslautogarage@gmail.com]
Sent: Monday, 9 May 2022 11:01 PM

To: Taufikh (LKK Auto)

Subject: Fwd: SMK 2636R FINALISE

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: Tsl Auto <tslautogarage @ gmail.com>

Date: Sun, 3 Apr 2022 at 6:35 PM

Subject: Re: SMK 2636R FINALISE

To: Taufikh (LKK Auto) <taufikh @lkkauto.com>
Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc @lkkauto.com>

Hi

How about with this case

We request close at $2500 lump sum



On Thu, 17 Mar 2022 at 6:08 PM, Taufikh (LKK Auto) <taufikh @Ilkkauto.com> wrote:

HI,

“Without Prejudice”

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of lumpsum $1300/- with 4 days of repair,
subject to their approval.

Regards
Taufikh

Lkk Auto



