Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Lauro Araos Songcuan JR <lauro.songcuan@cyclecarriage.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 23 August 2021 10:57 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Cc: Andre Chow En De; Loi Ai Ting; Coco Lu Ting; Admin A

Subject: Your Ref: CC4/LPC21008318/Eea3 (SLK710J)  Our Ref: SKW315R  DOA:
27/07/2021

Attachments: SKW315R - Letter of Demand.pdf

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Dear Asher,

Pls. refer to attached LOD.

Our customer, Chan’s & Sons Enterprise insured with NTUC claims as follows.

Cost of repair $ 2,086.50
Loss of rental S 910.00 (S130.00 x 7 days)
GIA search fee S 2.00
Total $2,998.50

Appreciate if you could quantify your offer of settlement the soonest.

Thank you so much.

Best regards,

Larry Songcuan
Customer Service

@@ Exceptional Journeys

CYCLE & CARRIAGE

Cycle & Carriage Singapore « 209 Pandan Gardens, Singapore 609339
T: +65 6568 4658 + F: +65 6565 1240 « www.cyclecarriage.com.sg

&F A member of the Jardine Cycle & Carriage Group

From: Lauro Araos Songcuan JR

Sent: 17 August 2021 02:37 PM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Andre Chow En De <andre.chow@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Loi Ai Ting <aiting.loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Coco Lu
Ting <coco.lu@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SKW315R (DPS) - FINALIZE TP CLAIM (LONPAC)

Dear Steve,



TAX INVOICE

Diplomat Parts Pte. Ltd.

Company Reg Mo. 196400304H
GST Reg No. MR-8500111-X

Invoice Name & Address

Owner Name & Vehicle Info

CHAN'S & SONS ENTERPRISE

363 SEMBAWANG ROAD
GOODLINK PARK

Reg No/Reg Date
Date In/Mileage

SKW315R / 14/10/2015
10/08/2021/ 86208

SINGAPORE 758379 Chassis No RU11102297
Engine No L15B4022298
Contact No Make/Model Vezel 1.5X CVT
Account No Terms Date/Time Printed CSE Operator WIP No Invoice/Credit Note No
CTP00060 Cash 20/08/2021/ 08:34 TLC 884 / Lauro Songcuan 26478 61022386
Description of Goods / Services Qty Unit Price  Disc% Amount
M BPNLUMP 1950.00
LUMP SUM REPAIR
Z TEXT N 3 e
TP CLAIM LONPAC - SLK710J
DOA: 27/07/2021
SURVEY: STEVE (LKK) 06/08/2021
04 DAYS
Parts 0.00 Nett 1,950.00
Labour 0.00 7% GST on 1950.00 136.50
Standard Menu 0.00
Specialist Job 0.00 Total Payable 2,086.50
Others(Lub,etc) 0.00 Paid 0.00
Sundry 1,950.00 Total Due 2,086.50
Total(w/o GST) 1,950.00
DPS Auto Services

209 Pandan Gardens, Singapore 609339 Tel: (65) 6568 4558 Fax: (65) 6567 5258



CHAN'S & SONS ENTERPRISE h .
23 Sennary o - cnans

Tel: 67532536 Fax 67567565 www.chans.com.sg
GST Reg No: 51-936300-M

Attn: Insurer of SLK710J
REF: Loss of Renta)

Accident Involving SKW315R & SLK710J on 27/07/2021 at commonweaith Ave

Vehicle Reg No . SKW315R 910.00
Make / Model : HONDA VEZEL

Period : 7 days

Unit Rate : 8% 130.00 Per Day (Including GST)

Reference No

Please make your cheques payable to : CHAN'S & SONS ENTERPRISE

For Official USe Only

Payment Date F/ Amt

CS/CC/CH
Cs/ccicH




7128/2021

INSURER ENQUIRY
Find
insurer

Vehicle reg. no.
slk710j
Date of Accident

27/07/2021 &

[ Reset

https:/iwww.gears.com.sgfinsurer-enquiry

Insurer Enquiry — GEARS

% RESULT & RECEIPT

TP Insurer Enquiry

Insurance

Lonpac Insurance Bhd

Period of Insurance

Requested By

Requested Date

03/01/2021 - 02/01/2022
LU TING (CYCLE & CARRIAGE A...

29/07/2021 16:35

Payment details

Request Amount: $$1.87

GST Amount: §50.13

Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive): $§2

General Insurance Association
Records Management Centre
GST Registration No: M400017735
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AUTHORIZATION TO ACT

|, CHANS él.: SoNS ENTERPRISE (“the third party claimant”)
of 363 sempawmic pokp GoobLikk pae < F593F4  (address), owner of
skw 3(ER (vehicle no.) hereby authorize

DIPLOMAT _PARTS PTE - \ID.
(“the workshop”) to act for me with respect to my claim for repair costs
and/or rental and/or loss of use(“claim”) for my vehicle no. _stw 35 R
that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on _27. 21, ==2|
(date) along__common Wem it m/enUE
(location) Involving vehicle no/s LK F104g
(*the accident™).

| further authorized the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a
manner that they deem fit and the workshop is further authorized to receive
payment further to settlement of my claim with payment cheque/s being
made in favour of the workshop.

| further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop any reach on my
behalf is on a without prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar
as the driver/owner/insurers of the other vehicle/s is concerned.

Dated this 21 day of o (month) 20_2( (year)

‘;\!
@1 ERp

2
bt

Signed by “the third party claimant” Signed by “the workshop”




