Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: 2020 SPRAYPAINTING <2020spraypainting@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 14 December 2021 2:45 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); cindy.tan@kannansg.com.sg
Subject: Re: SCH 9939E-DOA:3/8/2021

Dear Veron,

As for this vehicle SCH9939E , we accept the finalization of costs of repair $4,900 (5 working days).

Thank You.

Regards,

SHAH

Admin of

2020 SPRAY PAINTING PTE LTD.
H/p: 97166502

Email: 2020spraypainting @ gmail.com

On Tue, Dec 14, 2021 at 2:36 PM Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen @lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Shahh,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Confirmed Lump Sum $4900 @ 5 days

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315



Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: 2020 SPRAYPAINTING [mailto:2020spraypainting@gmail.com]
Sent: Thursday, 18 November 2021 4:16 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: SCH 9939E-DOA:3/8/2021

Noted with thanks.

On Thu, 18 Nov 2021, 16:13 Veron Chen (LKKAuto), <veronchen @lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Shah,

Not yet.

Will informed Adrian to finalize.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: 2020 SPRAYPAINTING [mailto:2020spraypainting@gmail.com]
Sent: Thursday, 18 November 2021 4:10 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: SCH 9939E-DOA:3/8/2021

Hi Veron,

Is the finalisation of this vehicle ready yet?

Thank You.

Regards,

SHAH

Admin of

2020 SPRAY PAINTING PTE LTD.
H/p: 97166502

Email: 2020spraypainting @ gmail.com

On Wed, Nov 17, 2021 at 2:47 PM Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen @lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Shah,

Would like to check vehicle repaired.

If vehicle has been repaired, will follow up with surveyor for finalize
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Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



