Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 3 December 2021 3:44 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SLA 5386G Estimate/Nissan Sylphy, TP/ERGO, DOA: 03.08.2021
Attachments: SLA 5386 COR.pdf

Hi Shiau Chan,

Can follow the marking attached.

Regards
Taufikh

From: Chia Sin Muk [mailto:em1lautopteltd@gmail.com]

Sent: Friday, 3 December 2021 12:05 PM

To: Taufikh (LKK Auto)

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SLA 5386G Estimate/Nissan Sylphy, TP/ERGO, DOA: 03.08.2021

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Taufikh,
We confirmed acceptance COR Lump sum $19,900 + 22 days.

Thanks & Best Regards,

Karen, on behalf of,

Chia Sin Muk (Mr)

m: (65) 9666 6556 | o: (65) 6452 3298 | f: (65) 6457 5776

EM-1 Auto Pte Ltd
Blk 8 #01-68 Sin Ming Industrial Estate Sector C Singapore 575643
Co. / GST Registration Number: 201316380R

On Thu, 2 Dec 2021 at 17:15, Taufikh (LKK Auto) <taufikh @lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Mr Chia,

Based on MV $51,000 and LTA REBATE $31,079. Repair limit is $19,920, therefore COR is I/s $19,900, 22 days.

Regards

Taufikh



Lkk Auto

From: Chia Sin Muk [mailto:em1lautopteltd@gmail.com]

Sent: Friday, 24 September 2021 12:21 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto); Team A

Subject: SLA 5386G Estimate/Nissan Sylphy, TP/ERGO, DOA: 03.08.2021

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Madam

Enclosed herewith estimate with price for your necessary action.

Thanks & Best Regards,
Annie, on behalf of,
Chia Sin Muk (Mr)

m: (65) 9666 6556 | 0: (65) 6452 3298 | f: (65) 6457 5776

EM-1 Auto Pte Ltd
Blk 8 #01-68 Sin Ming Industrial Estate Sector C Singapore 575643

Co. / GST Registration Number: 201316380R



