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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: EM Auto <emautosolution@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 28 September 2021 9:36 AM

To: TG Lim (LKK Auto)

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto); Derek; 'JOJO SIM'

Subject: RE: Finalisation of SMF  8926R

Morning Mr Lim 

 

Confirmed COR $4,000.00 – 5 working days. 

 

Thank you. 

 

Best Regards. 

 

From: TG Lim (LKK Auto) [mailto:TeowGuan@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Tuesday, 28 September, 2021 7:04 AM 

To: EM Auto <emautosolution@singnet.com.sg> 

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Finalisation of SMF 8926R 

 

Without Prejudice 

 

Hi 

 

Attached is the amended estimate of SMF 8926R 

 

Recommended COR is LS $ 4,000.00 with 5 repair days, subjected to the approval of the insurance company. 

Please confirm your acceptance of our final COR offer and send the LOD and all the necessary documents to our 

Case Handler Ms Shiau Chan ASAP. 

 

 

Best Regards, 

TG Lim | Automotive Assessor 

LKK Auto Consultants 

Phone: 6256 3561| Email:  TeowGuan@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 


