Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 2 September 2021 10:30 am

To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: FW: Request for finalization: SLJ686B Your Ref:

SNM21D204313/C02/SMQ8898E/LEWLC

From: Susan Seng <kentsengcarservices@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 2 September 2021 10:29:15 AM (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Request for finalization: SLJI686B Your Ref: SNM21D204313/C02/SMQ8898E/LEWLC

Dear Surveyor Rasul

We confirmed acceptance on $2300/6 repair days.

Kindly advise for LOD, we send in to China Taiping or to LKK?
Thank you

Kane
Kent Seng Car Services

On Wed, Sep 1, 2021 at 12:06 PM Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@|kkauto.com> wrote:
Hi Sebastian,

Refer to attachment

Audit check 1 item need price reduce.
Finalised amount is $ 2,300 / 6 days of repair
Kindly confirm

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.

From: kentsengcarservices@gmail.com [mailto:kentsengcarservices@gmail.com]

Sent: Monday, 30 August, 2021 2:22 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: Request for finalization: SLI686B Your Ref: SNM21D204313/C02/SMQ8898E/LEWLC

Dear Rasul

Good day,



Attachment is the after repair photo of SLI686B for your perusal.
Kindly assist to finalize the case with us at your earliest convenience.

Thank You

Best Regards
Sebastian

Kent Seng Car Services



