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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Guan Motor Works <guanmotorworks@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, 27 October 2022 3:37 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Subject: Re: Guan Motor Works - Settlement for JKK 4127 // LKK REF: 

C6/QBE21008247/Kps3q2

Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 
Account Name : GUAN MOTOR WORKS 
 
Account Number : 1073127705 
 
Bank Name :  United Overseas Bank (UOB) 
 
Bank & Branch Code : 7375 & 007 
 
Thank you. 
Pang 
Guan Motor Works 
 
 
On Wed, Oct 26, 2022 at 8:14 AM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

Dear Sirs, 

  

Please provide bank details for payment process. 

  

Account Name    
Account Number    
Bank Name    
Bank & Branch Code    

  

  

  

  

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of 
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / 
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 16 March 2022 11:14 AM
To: chongpc@wingtuck.com.sg
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING XE 1373G(QBE) AND JKK 4127 AT/ALONG BKE TO 

WOODLANDS ON 02/08/2021

16 March 2022 
                                                                
WING TUCK ENGINEERING PTE LTD                                                  [By Email Only] 
Driver: ANG AH HUAT 
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
  
You Ref: XE1373G 
Our Ref: CC6/QBE21008247/Krs3 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING XE 1373G(QBE) AND JKK 4127 AT/ALONG BKE TO WOODLANDS ON 02/08/2021 
 
We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor 
insurer, QBE Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy. 
 
We have received a claim from JKK 4127 against your motor insurance policy. 
 
Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had amongst other information 
given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to 
negotiate for an amicable settlement with third party claimant. 
 
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact 
us within 07 days from the date of this letter. 
 
Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected upon next renewal due to this Third-Party 
claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will 
be protected. 
  
Thank you. 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 
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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Robin Siow <robin.siow@qbe.com.my>
Sent: Tuesday, 20 September 2022 2:46 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Cc: Admin A; claims-singapore
Subject: RE: [Seek Mandate] - Your ref: BC208079// Our ref : CC6/QBE21008247/Kps3q2 

[ACCIDENT INVOLVING XE1373G(LONPAC) AND JKK4127(TP) ON 02/08/2019]

Hi Hsiao Tong, 
 
We are agreeable to settle the matter per the recommendation. 
 
Please provide us with the TP’s bank details for us to finalize the matter. 
 
Thanks. 
 
 
Regards, 
 
Robin Siow 

Claims Processing Analyst, Asia 

INTL Asia Claims Processing | Asia 

No. 638 Level 6, Block B1, Pusat Dagang Setia Jaya, Leisure Commerce Square 

+603 7861 8400 | 

Website LinkedIn Twitter 

 

 

 

  

    
Future CFO Excellence Awards 2022 – Winner of Excellence in Financial Planning & Analysis, Asia  
Future CFO Excellence Awards 2022 – Excellence in Operational Acconting and Control, Finalist, Malaysia   
Insurance Business Asia List – Elite Women 2021, Asia  
Insurance Business Asia List – Top Insurance Workplaces 2020, Asia  

 
I work flexibly and may send emails outside normal working hours. If you have received an email from me 
outside of your normal business hours I am not expecting you to read or respond unless it is urgent. 

 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 20 September, 2022 12:10 PM 
To: Robin Siow <robin.siow@qbe.com.my>; claims-singapore <claims-singapore@qbe.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: [Seek Mandate] - Your ref: BC208079// Our ref : CC6/QBE21008247/Kps3q2 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING 
XE1373G(LONPAC) AND JKK4127(TP) ON 02/08/2019] 
 

This email was sent from someone outside of QBE. Be cautious opening links and attachments. Use the ‘Report Phishing’ button 
if suspicious. 

  

URGENT 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
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We refer to our mandate request dated 05/05/2022. 
 
Kindly let us have your approval / instruction. 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Monday, 29 August 2022 4:02 PM 
To: claims-singapore <claims-singapore@qbe.com>; Robin Siow <robin.siow@qbe.com.my> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: [Seek Mandate] - Your ref: BC208079// Our ref : CC6/QBE21008247/Kps3q2 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING 
XE1373G(LONPAC) AND JKK4127(TP) ON 02/08/2019] 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
We refer to our mandate request dated 05/05/2022. 
 
Kindly let us have your approval / instruction. 
 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Wednesday, 27 July 2022 10:51 AM 
To: Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@qbe.com>; claims-singapore <claims-singapore@qbe.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: [Seek Mandate] - Your ref: BC208079// Our ref : CC6/QBE21008247/Kps3q2 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING 
XE1373G(LONPAC) AND JKK4127(TP) ON 02/08/2019] 
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Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
We refer to our mandate request dated 05/05/2022. 
 
Kindly let us have your approval / instruction. 
 

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Monday, 18 July 2022 10:48 AM 
To: Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@qbe.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: [Seek Mandate] - Your ref: BC208079// Our ref : CC6/QBE21008247/Kps3q2 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING 
XE1373G(LONPAC) AND JKK4127(TP) ON 02/08/2019] 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
We refer to our mandate request dated 05/05/2022. 
 
Kindly let us have your approval / instruction. 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Tuesday, 28 June 2022 10:46 AM 
To: Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@qbe.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: [Seek Mandate] - Your ref: BC208079// Our ref : CC6/QBE21008247/Kps3q2 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING 
XE1373G(LONPAC) AND JKK4127(TP) ON 02/08/2019] 
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Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
We refer to our mandate request dated 05/05/2022. 
 
Kindly let us have your approval / instruction. 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Wednesday, 1 June 2022 3:45 PM 
To: Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@qbe.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: [Seek Mandate] - Your ref: BC208079// Our ref : CC6/QBE21008247/Kps3q2 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING 
XE1373G(LONPAC) AND JKK4127(TP) ON 02/08/2019] 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
We refer to our mandate request dated 05/05/2022. 
 
Kindly let us have your approval / instruction. 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Thursday, 5 May 2022 11:37 AM 
To: Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@qbe.com>; claims-singapore <claims-singapore@qbe.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: [Seek Mandate] - Your ref: BC208079// Our ref : CC6/QBE21008247/Kps3q2 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING 
XE1373G(LONPAC) AND JKK4127(TP) ON 02/08/2019] 
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Your ref: BC208079 
Our ref : CC6/QBE21008247/Kps3q2 
  
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
  
ACCIDENT INVOLVING XE1373G(LONPAC) AND JKK4127(TP) ON 02/08/2019 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
  
Based on both parties report, the wooden plank dropped from our insured lorry and caused damage to third party 
vehicle. 
  
We seek your approval to offer repairer “GUAN MOTOR WORKS" at $5,007.45(all-in). 
 
The summary is as follows: - 
   

Amount Claimed Amount Revised 
1. Cost of Repair  $ 8,188.45 $ 4,300.00 
2. Loss of Rental (10days x $120.00) $ 1,200.00 $    700.00 (10days x $70.00) 
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $        7.49 $        7.45 

Total $ 9,395.94 $ 5,007.45 
   
Surveyor recommended 9days for repair + 1Sunday = 10days. 
  
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal. 
 
Kindly note that this inspection report dated 04/05/2022 is only for mandate purpose. 
 
Kindly let us have your approval / instruction. 
 
 
 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 
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