8/18/2021 Mail - Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) - Outlook

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKC 8000B & SCN 928P ALONG/AT HOOT KIAM RD ON
31/07/2021

Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>
Sun 8/15/2021 9:29 AM

To: szinnxx@gmail.com <szinnxx@gmail.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Our Ref: CC4/A1G21008246/Kra3

YEOH YOKE LAN - BY EMAIL ONLY
[POLICY HOLDER]

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKC 8000B & SCN 928P ALONG/AT HOOT KIAM RD ON 31/07/2021

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by
your motor insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third-party claim against your
policy.

We have received a claim from SCN 928P against your motor insurance policy.

Both parties involved have given conflict of version. Based on the circumstances of accident and both
parties damage profile, there is no conclusive evidence to substantiate either's party's version. Pursuant
to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had amongst other information
given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as the appointed agent of your insurers shall
proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with third party claimant.

If you have evidence/information to proof that we should not settle the third-party claim, kindly let us
have them in writing within the next 7 days i.e. by 23/08/2021 after we shall proceed with negotiation
with Third Party claimant on the without prejudice basis and any settlement should not bind any claims
whatsoever by you/your driver against the other party’s insurer arising from this particular accident.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for
commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third-Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD
protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

c.c. AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
(Motor Claims Dept)

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 27 September 2022 12:18 pm

To: CS A Team

Subject: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKC 8000B & SCN 928P ON 31/0/2021

From: service@kkimhin.com.sg <service@kkimhin.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 27 September 2022 12:17:32 pm (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: 'Margaret KKH' <margaret@kkimhin.com.sg>; service@kkimhin.com.sg <service@kkimhin.com.sg>
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKC 8000B & SCN 928P ON 31/0/2021

Dear Cecilia

Good day to you.

Following up on this case. In view of the conflict statement, can you advise liability?
Does your insured has video footage for this?

Our client has no video footage.

Best Regards

Sandra

6452 7018

9622 2116

K. Kim Hin Auto Pte Ltd

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, April 29, 2022 11:34 AM

To: claims@kkimhin.com.sg

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKC 8000B & SCN 928P ON 31/0/2021

Without Prejudice
Hi Sir/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter

Kindly let us have a copy of video footage to review the liability urgently.
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CIRCUMSTANCES OF ACCIDENT

| WAS DRIVING ALONG THE RIVER VALLEY ROAD AND HOOT KIAM ROAD AT THE SECOND LANE OF 3 LANES AND N
LEFT TURN TO HOOT KIAM ROAD. VEHICLE B WAS ALSO MAKING A LEFT TURN INTO HOOT KIAM ROAD, SUDDEMNLY
DID A MANEUVER GOING TOWARDS MY LANE AND COLLIDED ONTO THE LEFT PORTION OF MY VEHICLE AMD RESI
DAMAGES.

Thanks

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the

matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be
made via email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any
inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6749-4274 | MAIN: 6256 3561 | EMAIL: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| FAX: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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