Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Tan, Bennie-WZ <Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com>

Sent: Monday, 22 August 2022 9:51 pm

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto); Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: AIG REF: 2691009085SG-005 || ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLV9057U / SKU5362G ON

30/07/2021 *** LKK REF: CC4/A1G21008157/Kga3

Hi Cecilia
Thank you for your prompt reply.

Do upload your correspondent with TP to Merimem. To KIV till 10/09/2022. If there is no update then, please submit
your WP report and invoice for payment.

Best Regards

Bennie Tan
Senior Complex Claims Examiner - Auto Property Damage Claims
AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

AIG Building

78 Shenton Way, Level 10
Singapore 079120

Tel +(65) 6419 1718

Bennie-WZ.Tan®@aig.com | www.AlG.sg

Advanced Leave Notification:

If you have received this message outside of your usual work hours, | do not expect that you will read, respond to or action it until appropriate for you.

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 18 August 2022 5:43 pm

To: Tan, Bennie-WZ <Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: AIG REF: 26910090855G-005 || ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLV9057U / SKU5362G ON 30/07/2021
*** KK REF: CC4/AIG21008157/Kga3

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.
Hi Bennie,
The last correspondence with TP to request for evidence is on 11/02/2022.

Thanks

Best Regards,
Cecilia Chong | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
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From: Tan, Bennie-WZ <Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com>

Sent: Thursday, 18 August 2022 5:39 pm

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>; Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: AIG REF: 26910090855G-005 | | ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLV9057U / SKU5362G ON 30/07/2021 *** LKK REF:
CC4/A1G21008157/Kga3

Dear LKK
Reference to the above ageing matter.
Can you kindly provide an update on the latest development/last correspondent with TP repairer on this claim?

Best Regards

Bennie Tan
Senior Complex Claims Examiner - Auto Property Damage Claims
AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

AIG Building

78 Shenton Way, Level 10
Singapore 079120

Tel +(65) 6419 1718

Bennie-WZ.Tan®@aig.com | www.AlG.sg

Advanced Leave Notification:

If you have received this message outside of your usual work hours, | do not expect that you will read, respond to or action it until appropriate for you.

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 3 August 2021 1:08 pm

To: Tan, Bennie-WZ <Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com>; Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@|kkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: AIG REF: 26910090855G-005 || ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLV9057U / SKU5362G ON 30/07/2021
*** KK REF: CC4/AIG21008157/Kga3

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.

Dear Bennie,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.
Hi Cecila,

FYI and necessary action please.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.
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