8/3/2021 Mail - Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) - Outlook

Re: SLK130H TP AIG LKK - Supplementary estimate, marked estimate and additional
repair photo

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Tue 3/8/2021 9:47 AM

To: claim.autoworxhouse@gmail.com <claim.autoworxhouse@gmail.com>
Cc: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

[ﬂJ 1 attachments (617 KB)
TP ESTIMATE_MARKED(SLK130H).pdf;

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

For COR, recommended amount at L/sum $10,200.00(before GST) with 07repair days.

Kindly forward your LOD with all the relevant documents(ie: final repair bill, authorisation to act, rental
receipt) to us (LKK) for our necessary action.

Please note that all the finalisation subject to insurer approval.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be

deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the

issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: claim.autoworxhouse@gmail.com <W>

Sent: Saturday, 17 July 2021 2:28 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: SLK130H TP AIG LKK - Supplementary estimate, marked estimate and additional repair photo
Importance: High

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Are we able to finalise this case?
Thank you.

Best regards,

Admin Team
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Autoworx House

No.176 Sin Ming Drive
#02-01 Singapore 575721
Tel: 96725547 / 98634184
Fax: 64517423

From: claim.autoworxhouse@gmail.com <claim.autoworxhouse@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 19 April 2021 10:26 am

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: SLK130H TP AIG LKK - Supplementary estimate, marked estimate and additional repair photo
Importance: High

Hi Hsiao Tong,

As spoken with you last week, this care is very much urgent. Is a 1017 case. Need to close it asap.
Thank you.

Best regards,

Dylan Chew

Autoworx House

No.176 Sin Ming Drive

#02-01 Singapore 575721
claims.autoworxhouse@gmail.com
Tel: 64528211

Fax: 64517423

From: claim.autoworxhouse@gmail.com <claim.autoworxhouse @gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 22 May 2020 10:32 am

To: 'Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)' <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: SLK130H TP AIG LKK - Supplementary estimate, marked estimate and additional repair photo

Dear Kenneth,

Kindly help to finalise this case.
Thank you.

Best regards,

Ms. Lee

Autoworx House

No.176 Sin Ming Drive
#02-01 Singapore 575721
Tel: 96725547 / 98634184
Fax: 64517423

From: claim.autoworxhouse@gmail.com <claim.autoworxhouse@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 12 May 2020 12:01 pm

To: 'Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)' <KennethKong@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: SLK130H TP AIG LKK - Supplementary estimate, marked estimate and additional repair photo

Dear Kenneth,
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Are we able to finalise this case?
Thank you.

Best regards,

Ms. Lee

Autoworx House

No.176 Sin Ming Drive
#02-01 Singapore 575721
Tel: 96725547 / 98634184
Fax: 64517423

From: claim.autoworxhouse@gmail.com <claim.autoworxhouse@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 27 April 2020 2:45 pm

To: 'Vic (LKKAuto)' <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)' <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: SLK130H TP AIG LKK - Supplementary estimate, marked estimate and additional repair photo

Dear Sirs / Madam,

Are we able to finalise this case?
Thank you.

Best regards,

Ms. Lee

Autoworx House

No0.176 Sin Ming Drive
#02-01 Singapore 575721
Tel: 96725547 / 98634184
Fax: 64517423

From: claim.autoworxhouse@gmail.com <claim.autoworxhouse@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 17 January 2020 3:48 pm

To: 'Vic (LKKAuto)' <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: SLK130H TP AIG LKK - Supplementary estimate, marked estimate and additional repair photo

Dear Vic,

Are we able to finalise this case?
Thank you.

Best regards,

Ms. Lee

Autoworx House

No.176 Sin Ming Drive
#02-01 Singapore 575721
Tel: 96725547 / 87668115
Fax: 64517423

From: claim.autoworxhouse@gmail.com <claim.autoworxhouse @gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 11 October 2019 3:49 pm

To: 'Vic (LKKAuto)' <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: SLK130H TP AIG LKK - Supplementary estimate, marked estimate and additional repair photo

Dear Vic,

The above mentioned vehicle has not been finalised yet.

https://outlook.office.com/mail/sentitems/id/AAMKAGUOZDViNzgxLWESMTItNDkxMi1hZWIXLTA3MjhIMTAON2RiINgBGAAAAAADI7f6WE2MfQpPF%...  3/4


mailto:claim.autoworxhouse@gmail.com
mailto:claim.autoworxhouse@gmail.com
mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com
mailto:KennethKong@lkkauto.com
mailto:claim.autoworxhouse@gmail.com
mailto:claim.autoworxhouse@gmail.com
mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com
mailto:claim.autoworxhouse@gmail.com
mailto:claim.autoworxhouse@gmail.com
mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com
mailto:admin-a@lkkauto.com

8/3/2021 Mail - Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) - Outlook

| have attached the marked estimate, supplementary estimate and additional photos for your finalisation.
Kindly send us the latest estimate and finalised amount (if you have any) for us to finalise this matter.
Thank you!

Best regards,

Ms. Ho

Autoworx House

No.176 Sin Ming Drive
#02-01 Singapore 575721
Tel: 96725547 / 87668115
Fax: 64517423

From: admin <admin@supreme.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, November 15, 2017 12:39 PM

To: 'Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)' <KennethKong@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: 'Dylan Chew' <autoworxhouse@hotmail.com>

Subject: SLK130H TP AIG LKK - Supplementary estimate and additional repair photo

Hi Kenneth,

Attached our supplementary estimate and additional repair photo for your reference.
Can we finalize the repair cost for this matter?

Thank you.

Best regards,

Amanda Bee

Supreme Auto Service Pte Ltd
176 Sin Ming Drive

# 02-01 Singapore 575721

Tel : 6452 8211

Fax: 6451 7423

Email: admin@supreme.sg

https://outlook.office.com/mail/sentitems/id/AAMKAGUOZDViNzgxLWESMTItNDkxMi1hZWIXLTA3MjhIMTAON2RINgBGAAAAAADI7f6WE2MfQpPF%...  4/4


mailto:admin@supreme.sg
mailto:KennethKong@lkkauto.com
mailto:autoworxhouse@hotmail.com
mailto:admin@supreme.sg

