11/21/21, 12:27 PM Mail - Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) - Outlook

Re: ACC INV FBS 2519J AND SKX 4505C ON 15.07.2021 *** LKK REF: CC4/A1G21008135/Epa3

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Sun 21/11/2021 12:26 PM

To: Southern Motor <soumotorclaims@hotmail.com>

@J 1 attachments (193 KB)
DV_FBS 2519J.pdf;

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
Thank you for your acceptance.

Please duly sign the documents enclosed and return to us (LKK) for our necessary action.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the matter amicably

without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages,

either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related documents
will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Southern Motor <soumotorclaims@hotmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 19 November 2021 1:53 pm

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: ACC INV FBS 2519) AND SKX 4505C ON 15.07.2021 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIG21008135/Epa3

Hi,

We confirm acceptance of your offer $750.00.

Thank You

Southern Motor
6273-0369

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, November 18, 2021 2:18 PM

To: Southern Motor <soumotorclaims@hotmail.com>

Subject: Re: ACC INV FBS 2519J AND SKX 4505C ON 15.07.2021 *** LKK REF: CC4/AlG21008135/Epa3

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.

Kindly refer to our insured accident report for your easy reference. Our driver reported that your client moved off from parked position
while our driver was filtering lane.

We would like to propose settlement at a global sum of $750.00(all-in).
Please confirm acceptance.

SKX4505C Police Report
https://outlook.office.com/mail/sentitems/id/AAMKAGUOZDViNzgxLWESMTItNDkxMi1hZWIXLTA3MjhIMTAON2RiINgBGAAAAAADI7f6WE2MfQpPF%... 1/6
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Brief Details.

On the 15/07/2021 at about 0853hrs, | was driving my vehicle (SKX4505C) at Ayer Rajah Expressway
(AYE) towards Clementi Ave 6. | was driving on the third lane of a four lane road with the fourth lane
turning left only.

| wanted to filter lane to the fourth lane. While | was filtering lane, a motorcycle (FBS2519J) which was
parked at the road shoulder moved off and my vehicle side swiped his vehicle. He fell off the motorcycle
and | stopped my vehicle at the side of the road to make a check on him. | called the ambulance for him
as he informed he requires ambulance. When the ambulance came, they make a check on him and
assisted me to call Traffic Police. | waited for Traffic Police to ceme. My vehicle suffered damages on the
front left side.

The rider was not conveyed to any hospital. The Traffic Police took down our particulars and all left. | also
managed to exchange particulars with the rider. The rider supericr also came and | managed to get his
gontact number instead of the rider. The contact number of his superior (Thomas) is 92372094. | wish tc
note that | am not injured. | wish to note that | do not have the report number for the accident.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the matter amicably

without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages,

either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related documents
will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 21 October 2021 3:58 pm

To: Southern Motor <soumotorclaims@hotmail.com>

Subject: RE: ACC INV FBS 2519 AND SKX 4505C ON 15.07.2021 *** LKK REF: CC4/AlIG21008135/Epa3

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We acknowledge receipt of your email dated 21/10/2021.

We will look into the matter and get back to you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the matter amicably

without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages,
either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
5(408933)
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From: Southern Motor <soumotorclaims@hotmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 21 October 2021 10:44 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: ACC INV FBS 2519) AND SKX 4505C ON 15.07.2021 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIG21008135/Epa3

Hi Hsiao,
Kindly check LOD.
Thank You

TiTi
Southern Motor
6273-0369

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, October 11, 2021 10:13 AM

To: Southern Motor <soumotorclaims@hotmail.com>

Subject: Re: ACC INV FBS 2519) AND SKX 4505C ON 15.07.2021 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIG21008135/Epa3

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Thank you for your photos.

Kindly provide police investigation result for this matter.

Meantime, please submit LOD in order for us to seek mandate/instruction from AIG.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this

negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of

liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arranaement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Southern Motor <soumotorclaims@hotmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 8 October 2021 11:52 am

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: ACC INV FBS 2519) AND SKX 4505C ON 15.07.2021 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIG21008135/Epa3

Hi Hsiao Tong,

Kindly check scene photos (for evidence) and see attach (sketch plan)
We shall be much obliged if you would let us know

whether the above motorcycle FBS2519J is authorized for

direct settlement .

Thank You

TiTi

Southern Motor

6273-0369
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From: Southern Motor <soumotorclaims@hotmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, September 29, 2021 10:35 AM

To: chewht@Ikkauto.com <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Fw: ACC INV FBS 2519) AND SKX 4505C ON 15.07.2021 *** LKK REF: CC4/A1G21008135/Epa3

Hi Hsiao Tong,

Kindly check scene photos (for evidence).

We shall be much obliged if you would let us know
whether the above motorcycle FBS2519J is authorized for
direct settlement .

Thank You

TiTi
Southern Motor
6273-0369

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, September 24, 2021 9:47 PM

To: Southern Motor <soumotorclaims@hotmail.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ilkkauto.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ACC INV FBS 2519) AND SKX 4505C ON 15.07.2021 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIG21008135/Epa3

Dear Ti Ti,

Thank you for your email.

Please see attched email from Hsiao Tong.
Hi HT,

FYI please.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related documents
will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: Southern Motor [mailto:soumotorclaims@hotmail.com]

Sent: Friday, September 24, 2021 11:54 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: ACC INV FBS 2519J AND SKX 4505C ON 15.07.2021 *** LKK REF: CC4/AlIG21008135/Epa3

Hi,

Kindly check Scene photo & attached .
May | Know Liability is clear or not.

Thank You

TiTi
Southern Motor
6273-0369

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Tuesday, August 3, 2021 6:11 PM
To: Southern Motor <soumotorclaims@hotmail.com>
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Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: ACC INV FBS 2519) AND SKX 4505C ON 15.07.2021 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIG21008135/Epa3

Dear Ti Ti,
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that OI has reported. Please refer to the below OI’ s sketch plan and statement.
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Brief Details.

On the 15/07/2021 at about 0853hrs, | was driving my vehicle (SKX4505C) at Ayer Rajah Expressway
(AYE) towards Clementi Ave 6. | was driving on the third lane of a four lane road with the fourth lane
turning left only.

| wanted to filter lane to the fourth lane. While | was filtering lane, a motorcycle (FBS2519J) which was
parked at the road shoulder moved off and my vehicle side swiped his vehicle. He fell off the motorcycle
and | stopped my vehicle at the side of the road to make a check on him. | called the ambulance for him
as he informed he requires ambulance. When the ambulance came, they make a check on him and
assisted me to call Traffic Police. | waited for Traffic Police to come. My vehicle suffered damages on the
front left side.

The rider was not conveyed to any hospital. The Traffic Police took down our particulars and all left. | also
managed to exchange particulars with the rider. The rider supericr also came and | managed to get his
contact number instead of the rider. The contact number of his superior (Thomas) is 92372094, | wish to
note that | am not injured. | wish to note that | do not have the report number for the accident.

Please provide us the following
e evidence i.e. video/ scene photo / note
e PIR (ifany)
e estimated cost of repair
e GIA /police report

Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Hsiao Tong.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related documents
will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.
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From: Southern Motor [mailto:soumotorclaims@hotmail.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 3 August 2021 6:06 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject:

Hi,

Kindly advise us whether the liability is clear before repair the motorcycle FBS2519) .
Thank You

TiTi

Southern Motor
6273-0369
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