Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 1 October 2021 2:24 PM
To: SUR; CS A Team
Subject: FW: SME 2665M DOA : 31/07/21

From: donavan.leong@mtmperformancegroup.com <donavan.leong@mtmperformancegroup.com>
Sent: Friday, 1 October 2021 2:23:34 PM (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SME 2665M DOA : 31/07/21

Good day Rasul,
Thanks will confirm the finalise at $2500 and 6 repair days

Regards,

Donavan leong
HP:97974474
MTM Automotiq

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Friday, 1 October 2021 10:53 am

To: donavan.leong@mtmperformancegroup.com
Subject: SME 2665M DOA : 31/07/21

Hi Don,

Refer to attachment
Finalised amount is $ 2,500 / 6 days of lump sum repair
Kindly confirm

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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