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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 8 February 2022 9:25 AM
To: 'Stephen Yeo'
Subject: RE: Finalization SMR638L DOA: 27/07/2021// LKK Ref: CC4/LPC21008128/Epa3q2
Attachments: DV_SMR638L.pdf

Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
Thank you for your acceptance. 
 
Please duly sign the DV enclosed and return to us (LKK) for our necessary action. 
 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 
"Wishing You Happiness & Prosperity Chinese New Year 2022" 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Stephen Yeo <stephenyeo@hongseh.com.sg>  
Sent: Monday, 7 February 2022 2:01 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Finalization SMR638L DOA: 27/07/2021// LKK Ref: CC4/LPC21008128/Epa3q2 
 
Dear Hsiao Tong 
 
We are aggregable to your offer of $ 11,572.71 for Cost of Repairs and Loss of Use. 
 
Thank you for your kind attention. 
 
Regards 
Stephen Yeo 
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From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 3 February, 2022 9:59 AM 
To: Stephen Yeo <stephenyeo@hongseh.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: Finalization SMR638L DOA: 27/07/2021// LKK Ref: CC4/LPC21008128/Epa3q2 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
We propose settlement as follows: - 
 

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 10,772.71 
2. Loss of Use (8days x $100.00) $      800.00 

Total $ 11,572.71 
 
Please confirm acceptance. 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 
"Wishing You Happiness & Prosperity Chinese New Year 2022" 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Friday, 28 January 2022 2:47 PM 
To: Stephen Yeo <stephenyeo@hongseh.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: Finalization SMR638L DOA: 27/07/2021// LKK Ref: CC4/LPC21008128/Epa3q2 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
We acknowledge receipt of your email dated 28/01/2022. 
 
We will look into the matter and get back to you asap. 
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Thank you. 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 
"Wishing You Happiness & Prosperity Chinese New Year 2022" 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Stephen Yeo <stephenyeo@hongseh.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, 28 January 2022 2:44 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Finalization SMR638L DOA: 27/07/2021// LKK Ref: CC4/LPC21008128/Epa3q2 
 
Dear Hsiao Tong 
 
Please refer to attached for you necessary action. 
 
Thank you for your kind attention. 
 
Regards 
Stephen Yeo 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 27 January, 2022 5:35 PM 
To: Stephen Yeo <stephenyeo@hongseh.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: Finalization SMR638L DOA: 27/07/2021// LKK Ref: CC4/LPC21008128/Epa3q2 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs, 
 
Further to our below email. 
 
Kindly forward your LOD with all the relevant documents(ie: final repair bill, authorisation to act, rental receipt) to 
us (LKK) for our necessary action. 
 
Thank you. 
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“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 
"Wishing You Happiness & Prosperity Chinese New Year 2022" 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Friday, 21 January 2022 9:00 AM 
To: Stephen Yeo <stephenyeo@hongseh.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: Finalization SMR638L DOA: 27/07/2021// LKK Ref: CC4/LPC21008128/Epa3q2 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs, 
 
Further to our below email. 
 
Kindly forward your LOD with all the relevant documents(ie: final repair bill, authorisation to act, rental receipt) to 
us (LKK) for our necessary action. 
 
Thank you. 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 
"Wishing You Happiness & Prosperity Chinese New Year 2022" 
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Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 25 November 2021 9:16 PM 
To: Stephen Yeo <stephenyeo@hongseh.com.sg> 
Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Finalization SMR638L 
 
Hi Stephen, 
 
The LOD please sent to LKK - Hsiao Tong. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Thanks. 
 
Best Regards, 
Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

From: Stephen Yeo <stephenyeo@hongseh.com.sg> 
Sent: Thursday, 25 November 2021 3:01 pm 
To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Finalization SMR638L  
  
Dear Steve 
  
Thank you for the finalize amount, we are agreeable to the amount. 
Please let me know where to send the Invoice and Letter of Demand. 
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Regards 
Stephen Yeo 
  

 
  
Hong Seh Motors Pte Ltd 
10 Fourth Lok Yang Road Singapore 629707 
HP: +65 9720 0673  
Email: stephenyeo@hongseh.com.sg 
  
  

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 26 October, 2021 9:51 PM 
To: Stephen Yeo <stephenyeo@hongseh.com.sg> 
Subject: Finalization SMR638L 
  
Hi Stephen, 
  
Kindly refer our finalize.  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
Thanks. 
  
Best Regards, 
Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

From: Stephen Yeo <stephenyeo@hongseh.com.sg> 
Sent: Monday, 25 October 2021 5:47 pm 
To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Finalization SMR638L  
  
Dear Steve 
 
Please refer to attached for your consideration. 
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Thank you 


