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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: jouis <jouis@jinauto.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 5 August 2021 4:36 PM
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: Accident Involving Vehicle SCX7343C  and  GBB6124C ( YOUR INSURED ) ON 31 

/7/2021
Attachments: SCX7343C LOA AND REPAIR BILL.pdf

Follow Up Flag: Flag for follow up
Flag Status: Completed

Dear Asher , 
 
We submit our claim as follow : 
 
Repair cost              S$ 1712.00 
Loss of  Use             S$  300.00  ( 3days)  
 
Please let us have your offer to settle . 
 
Thank you & Best  Regards, 
Jouis Seow  
Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd 
Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10  
Singapore 539195. 
  
Tel        : (65) 62898126 
Fax       : (65) 62870590 
Email    : jouis@jinauto.com.sg  
  
 

From: jouis [mailto:jouis@jinauto.com.sg]  
Sent: Monday, 2 August 2021 12:16 PM 
To: 'Su Li (LKK Auto)' <suli@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Accident Involving Vehicle SCX7343C and GBB6124C ( YOUR INSURED ) ON 31 /7/2021 
 
Hi Su li, 
 
 
Claim against  GBB6124C ( insured with AIG)  
 
Thank you & Best  Regards, 
Jouis Seow  
Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd 
Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10  
Singapore 539195. 
  
Tel        : (65) 62898126 
Fax       : (65) 62870590 
Email    : jouis@jinauto.com.sg  
  
 






