Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: jouis <jouis@jinauto.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 5 August 2021 4:36 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Accident Involving Vehicle SCX7343C and GBB6124C ( YOUR INSURED ) ON 31
/7/2021

Attachments: SCX7343C LOA AND REPAIR BILL.pdf

Follow Up Flag: Flag for follow up

Flag Status: Completed

Dear Asher,

We submit our claim as follow :

Repair cost S$1712.00
Loss of Use SS 300.00 ( 3days)

Please let us have your offer to settle .

Thank you & Best Regards,
Jouis Seow

Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10
Singapore 539195.

Tel : (65) 62898126
Fax : (65) 62870590
Email :jouis@jinauto.com.sg

From: jouis [mailto:jouis@jinauto.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 2 August 2021 12:16 PM

To: 'Su Li (LKK Auto)' <suli@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Accident Involving Vehicle SCX7343C and GBB6124C ( YOUR INSURED ) ON 31 /7/2021

Hi Su li,

Claim against GBB6124C ( insured with AlG)

Thank you & Best Regards,
Jouis Seow

Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10
Singapore 539195.

Tel : (65) 62898126
Fax : (65) 62870590
Email :jouis@jinauto.com.sg




LETTER OF AUTHORITY

To: Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd
Rlock 14 Defi1 Lane 10
#01-410/412
Singapore 539195

Dear Sir
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SO¢ 1343 T g GBRB LMY & gy 3 H’{ 2ey

1/We, the owner of vehicle no, 3CX 5k .hereby instruct and authorise you to commence
repairs to the said vehicle.

I/We hereby appoint you recover my damages sustained in the above accident.
Please recover the following:

1. Cost of repairs
2. Loss Of Use/Rental fees

You may proceed to apply to the relevant authorities for all necessary reports/documents to
enable you to process my claim. Thereafter, you may negotiate with the third party and or his
insurers for a settlement. If a settlement cannot be reached, I/'we, will commence legal
proceedings against third party to recover my/our damages and the entire amount claimed
shall belong and make payable to Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd absolutely.

I/We further authorize you to give an absolute discharge on my/our behalf and to sign discharge
voucher(s), any other documents necessary or incidentals to the conduct and disposal of my/our
above claims.

Yours faithfully

NamV
NRIC NO:
Address:

Dated: 31/07/2021




RELEASE VOUCHER
(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim)

“We/l, JIN AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD (“the workshop”) hereby confirm that we/I have
reached an agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd LKK
AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for
S$$1.712.00 (Repair Cost), $$300.00 (Loss of Useemtat), S§ - (Disbursement) for vehicle no.
SCX 7343C that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 31/07/2021 (date) along
291 YISHUN STREET 22 CAR PARK (location) involving vehicle no/s GBB 6124C. This is
pursuant to the inspection conducted on 03/08/2021 (date) at “the workshop”.

We/I confirm that we/I are/am authorized by the owner TEQO SHOO KHUANG (“the third party
claimant™) of vehicle no. SCX 7343C make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and we/I
have full authority to settle the matter on his/her behalf in a manner that we/I deem fit. We/I enclose
herein the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant”.

We/I further confirm that we/I will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd for all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party
claimant™ after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and
expenses suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the
damage to SCX 7343C (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/I confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant” pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a
without prejudice and without admission of liability basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have

exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

Dated this ___ 9 (day) of SEP (month) 2021 (year)

9‘-“ Wc‘
%ﬂ

Signed by appointed surveyor Slgned o) orkshop” (with chop)

A}-o

B



o JIN Autro SERviIces PTe LD
JINABEO 2 110k 102 Detu Lae 10 Singapare 539195

Email: jin@jinauto.com.sg
Company Reg. No: 200704370C GST Reg. No: 200704370C

TAX INVOICE

Mis I&r\ﬁ P’SQ\YC\ PO\C]%C \V\»SUf&v\(&. m’tuﬂk InvoiceNo: 1 8241
VehicleNo:g-QC 4'3 (’LB <

Date: 'gf 8‘ 20 .

Quantity DESCRIPTION Amount
DX o pecided: 31\w{20)
V)
Mg Guns g [600 |~
¥

N.B No responsibility will be accepted for any loss or E & O.E. ADDGST | & ﬂ [ D_.—/(/\J‘
damage to any Vehicles or parts left in this workshop
for any reason whatsoever. TOTAL ¢~ [ '%L{ Y~ (PN

l\v/d

Jin AuTo \S‘JEF%CES Pte Lt




Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 6 August 2021 9:30 AM

To: sales@candyworld.com.sg

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBB 6124C AND SCX 7343C ON 31/07/2021

Our Ref: CC6/A1G21008119/Ues3

06 AUG 2021

CANDY WORLD MARKETING (S) PTE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBB 6124C AND SCX 7343C ON 31/07/2021

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve
the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to
negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please
contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

Asher

Case Handler

DID: 6841 6051

FAX: 6741 4108

Email: ashersng(@lkkauto.com

c.c.  China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
(Motor Claims Dept)



9/1/2021 Merimen e-Claims

Print Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*SCX7343C (3090190500SG)
[GBB6124C]
TP
TEO SHOO KHUANG
Jul 31 2021 5:00PM
[CANDY WORLD MARKETING (S) PTE LTD]
Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

From AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) (AIG_SG_EXPRESS), sent on 25/08/2021 09:08 AM.

To LKK_HQ
Subject Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$2012.00) - SCX7343C - Claim Handler: Loh, Chee-Heng

Approved:2012.00.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_Print& CFID=87438060&CFTOKEN=6ec6fb69b086444-36...  1/1



