Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Attachments:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Thank you for your acceptance.

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Tuesday, 21 June 2022 9:47 AM

Claims

RE: Survey Vehicle SLB7565M *** LKK REF: CC4/11121008073/pa3  (Acc on 25.07.21
invlg GBJ 970 2)

DV_SLB7565M.pdf

We confirm settlement at a global sum of $12,700.00(all-in).

Please duly sign the documents enclosed and return to us (LKK) for our necessary action.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: Lily <bhlim@procarcare.com.sg> On Behalf Of Claims

Sent: Monday, 20 June 2022 4:45 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Claims <claims@procarcare.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Survey Vehicle SLB7565M *** LKK REF: CC4/11121008073/pa3 (Acc on 25.07.21 invlg GBJ 970 2)

Dear Hsiao Tong

Confirm acceptance, please send DV

Thank you

Regards,



Lily LIM

Claims Advisory

Progressive Car Care Pte Ltd

Blk 3022A Ubi Road 1 #01-45/46 Singapore 408716
T:+65 67415336 | F:+656741 7208

E: claims@procarcare.com.sg

W: www.procarcare.com.sg

PROGRESSIVE
CAR CARE PTE LTD

IMPORTANT NOTICE: The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended
recipient, you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please
immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts
thereof.

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, June 20, 2022 8:54 AM

To: Claims <claims@procarcare.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Survey Vehicle SLB7565M *** LKK REF: CC4/11121008073/pa3 (Acc on 25.07.21 invlg GBJ 970 2)

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/mdm,

Apologised for late response.

We propose settlement at a global sum of $12,700.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)




From: Lily <bhlim@procarcare.com.sg> On Behalf Of Claims

Sent: Saturday, 18 June 2022 1:18 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Claims <claims@procarcare.com.sg>

Subject: FW: Survey Vehicle SLB7565M *** LKK REF: CC4/11121008073/pa3 (Acc on 25.07.21 invlg GBJ 970 Z)
Importance: High

Dear Hsiao Tong

Please refer to our numerous reminders pertaining to the settlement of this case.

It has been long outstanding and no reply from your side. Kindly revert your offer for settlement and your
Immediate attention/action would greatly appreciated.

Thank you

Regards,

Lily LIM

Claims Advisory

Progressive Car Care Pte Ltd

Blk 3022A Ubi Road 1 #01-45/46 Singapore 408716
T:+65 67415336 | F:+656741 7208

E: claims@procarcare.com.sg

W: www.procarcare.com.sg

o PROGRESSIVE
CAR CARE PTELTD

IMPORTANT NOTICE: The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended
recipient, you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please
immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts
thereof.



