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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 19 October 2021 2:39 pm
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Cc: MT_Claim_SG
Subject: FW: 50113521 / CITYCAB TAXI SHB2293C / TP VEH XD3964T  / DOA 23/07/2021 - 

ARRANGE SURVEY  LKK REF : CC4/LPC21008057/gs3 [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - General 
 
 
 
Dear Cecilia, 
 
We have no objections to the proposed quantum but we suggest to make a global offer of 
$18,500.00 first. 
 
 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: CHEW BENG KEE <bkchew@lonpac.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 19 October 2021 2:30 pm 
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: RE: 50113521 / CITYCAB TAXI SHB2293C / TP VEH XD3964T / DOA 23/07/2021 - ARRANGE SURVEY LKK REF : 
CC4/LPC21008057/gs3 [External Confidential] 
 
Lonpac External - Confidential 
Hi Gerald 
 
OK, pls proceed with TPPD claims settlement as proposed. 
Thank you. 
 
 
Best Regards 
Mr Chew Beng Kee 
Head of Claims | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 246 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 
 
In view of the revised measures for transition under Phase 2 COVID-19 restrictions effective 
27 September 2021 (Internal), 50% of our staff will be working from home. Please expect 
delays in our replies, payments and claims settlements during this period. Your understanding 
is greatly appreciated and we apologise for any inconvenience caused. 
 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt practices. 
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Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only. 
 
From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 19 October 2021 2:15 pm 
To: CHEW BENG KEE <bkchew@lonpac.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: FW: 50113521 / CITYCAB TAXI SHB2293C / TP VEH XD3964T / DOA 23/07/2021 - ARRANGE SURVEY LKK REF : 
CC4/LPC21008057/gs3 [External Confidential] 
 

Lonpac External - General 
 
Hi Chew, 
 
Attached supporting documents for DS for your approval. 
 
Thank you.  
 
Best Regards 
 
Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 

 
 
“In view of the revised measures for COVID-19 restrictions effective 27 September 
2021, more than 50% of our staff will be working from home. Please expect delays in 
our replies, payments and claims settlements during this period. Your understanding 
is greatly appreciated and we apologise for any inconvenience caused”. 
 
 
 
 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 19 October 2021 1:43 pm 
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> 
Subject: RE: 50113521 / CITYCAB TAXI SHB2293C / TP VEH XD3964T / DOA 23/07/2021 - ARRANGE SURVEY LKK REF : 
CC4/LPC21008057/gs3 [External Confidential] 
 

Lonpac Ref: 21/21/21/VC05/024797 

LKK Ref: CC4/LPC21008057/gs3 
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Dear Sirs/Madam, 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

We have highlighted to your good office on 10/08/2021 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with our 
Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd. 

  

OI CHARGED FOR CARELESS DRIVING CAUSING HURT. Liability is not in our driver’s favour. 

  

Summary to offer to third party repairer, “DING AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD” is as follows: - 

  

  Claimed Amount Revised Amount 
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 40,550.64 $ 16,478.00 
2. Loss of Rental (25days x $117.20) $   2,930.00 $   1,523.60 (20days x $76.18) 

– 35% rental waiver 
3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee $          2.00 $        2.00 
4. Loss of Income (25days x $80.00) $  2,000.00 $   1,000.00 (20days x $50.00) 
5. Towing Fee $       75.00 $        75.00   

Total $ 45,557.64 $ 19,078.60 

  

**14days recommendation for repair + 3sundays + 1PH + 2PRS = 20days.  

The above is for your approval. 

 
 

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 19 October 2021 1:30 pm 
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: 50113521 / CITYCAB TAXI SHB2293C / TP VEH XD3964T / DOA 23/07/2021 - ARRANGE SURVEY LKK REF : 
CC4/LPC21008057/gs3 [External Confidential] 
 

Lonpac External - General 
 
 
Can you resend with the attachments? 
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We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 19 October 2021 1:13 pm 
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: RE: 50113521 / CITYCAB TAXI SHB2293C / TP VEH XD3964T / DOA 23/07/2021 - ARRANGE SURVEY LKK REF : 
CC4/LPC21008057/gs3 [External Confidential] 
 

Lonpac Ref: 21/21/21/VC05/024797 

LKK Ref: CC4/LPC21008057/gs3 

  

Dear Sirs/Madam, 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

We have highlighted to your good office on 10/08/2021 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with our 
Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd. 

  

OI CHARGED FOR CARELESS DRIVING CAUSING HURT. Liability is not in our driver’s favour. 

  

Summary to offer to third party repairer, “DING AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD” is as follows: - 

  

  Claimed Amount Revised Amount 
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 40,550.64 $ 16,478.00 
2. Loss of Rental (25days x $117.20) $   2,930.00 $   1,523.60 (20days x $76.18) 

– 35% rental waiver 
3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee $          2.00 $        2.00 
4. Loss of Income (25days x $80.00) $  2,000.00 $   1,000.00 (20days x $50.00) 
5. Towing Fee $       75.00 $        75.00   

Total $ 45,557.64 $ 19,078.60 

  

**14days recommendation for repair + 3sundays + 1PH + 2PRS = 20days.  

The above is for your approval. 
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From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 19 October 2021 12:59 pm 
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: RE: 50113521 / CITYCAB TAXI SHB2293C / TP VEH XD3964T / DOA 23/07/2021 - ARRANGE SURVEY LKK REF : 
CC4/LPC21008057/gs3 [External Confidential] 
 

Lonpac External - General 
 
Dear Cecilia, 
 
Please advise your mandate of $117.20 per day is after the 35% rental waiver? 
 
Thank you.  
 
Best Regards 
 
Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 

 
 
“In view of the revised measures for COVID-19 restrictions effective 27 September 
2021, more than 50% of our staff will be working from home. Please expect delays in 
our replies, payments and claims settlements during this period. Your understanding 
is greatly appreciated and we apologise for any inconvenience caused”. 
 
 
 
 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 19 October 2021 12:51 pm 
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: RE: 50113521 / CITYCAB TAXI SHB2293C / TP VEH XD3964T / DOA 23/07/2021 - ARRANGE SURVEY LKK REF : 
CC4/LPC21008057/gs3 [External Confidential] 
 
Dear Gerald,  
 
Have check online, yes they have a rental waiver of up to 35% till August 2021. Attached screenshot taken from the 
website for your reference too.  
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Thanks  
 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the 
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this 
negotiation of terms/settlement. 
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of 
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be 
made via email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any 
inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
 
Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 
 
 

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 19 October 2021 10:17 am 
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: RE: 50113521 / CITYCAB TAXI SHB2293C / TP VEH XD3964T / DOA 23/07/2021 - ARRANGE SURVEY LKK REF : 
CC4/LPC21008057/gs3 [External Confidential] 
 

Lonpac External - General 
 
Dear Cecilia, 
 
The accident occurred in July 2021 and there should be some waiver of rental up to 25%. 
 
Please check before we revert. 
 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, 18 October 2021 3:33 pm 
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: RE: 50113521 / CITYCAB TAXI SHB2293C / TP VEH XD3964T / DOA 23/07/2021 - ARRANGE SURVEY LKK REF : 
CC4/LPC21008057/gs3 [External Confidential] 
 

Lonpac Ref: 21/21/21/VC05/024797 

LKK Ref: CC4/LPC21008057/gs3 

  

Dear Sirs/Madam, 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

We have highlighted to your good office on 10/08/2021 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with our 
Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd. 

  

OI CHARGED FOR CARELESS DRIVING CAUSING HURT. Liability is not in our driver’s favour. 
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Summary to offer to third party repairer, “DING AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD” is as follows: - 

  

  Claimed Amount Revised Amount 
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 40,550.64 $ 16,478.00 
2. Loss of Rental (25days x $117.20) $   2,930.00 $   2,344.00 (20days x 

$117.20) 
3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee $          2.00 $        2.00 
4. Loss of Income (25days x $80.00) $  2,000.00 $   1,000.00 (20days x $50.00) 
5. Towing Fee $       75.00 $        75.00   

Total $ 45,557.64 $ 19,899.00 

  

**14days recommendation for repair + 3sundays + 1PH + 2PRS = 20days. 

  

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference. 

  

The above is for your approval. 

 

 
 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence 

should be made via email.  Submission of claim related documents will be 

in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
 
Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

 
 


