Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

From: Simon Ho (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 14 March 2022 10:30 AM
To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Finalization for PD1131M

Dear Celine,

Audit check done for PD1131M without problem.

Best Regards,

Simon Ho

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561| email: simonho@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 14 March, 2022 10:17 AM
To: Simon Ho (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: Finalization for PD1131M

Dear Simon,

File for audit check.

Best Regards,

Celine Fong

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 8 March 2022 9:52 PM

To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Lau <connect3lau@gmail.com>; Winnie Chai <connect3winnie@gmail.com>
Subject: Finalization for PD1131M

Hi Celine,



Kindly seek mandate MSIG Insurance for finalize $1945 (P/P, before GST). 2 days.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@I|kkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Winnie Chai <connect3winnie@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 8 March 2022 3:14 pm

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>; Lau <connect3lau@gmail.com>
Subject: Finalization for PD1131M

Hi Steve

Attached is the after repair photos.
Pls kindly revert on finalization.
Thanks

Winnie Chai

Connect3
HP:9850-9666



